From: Lloyd, Abigail

To: Ferguson, Alexis; Lanford, Caroline

Cc: Williams, Kimberly; Grants Center Of Excellence Distribution; Ondrovic, John
Subject: RE: Grants - Intent to Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Complete Streets Program
Date: Wednesday, October 6, 2021 12:37:45 PM

Attachments: image002.png

Hello!

OMB has no objection to the Department of Housing and Community Development submitting a
grant application to Forward Pinellas for the Complete Streets Program for Concept Planning and
Design to make improvements to Whitney Road between US 19 and Bolesta Road.

This is a single-year reimbursement grant project that will likely impact FY22. The requested funding
is $50,000 with no expected match. The total project is estimated to cost $100,000, total match of
which will be provided by in-kind services of existing county resources.

The County Administrator does not need to sign the application for the County, Director approval
will be sufficient. Please include this email when you send the application through Granicus. The
review shall include the Director, and Assistant County Administrator along with any others as
defined in Granicus/Legistar standard operating procedures.

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me. Thank you!

Abigail Lloyd

Budget & Financial Management Analyst
Pinellas County Office of Management & Budget
14 S. Fort Harrison Ave., 5th Floor

Clearwater, FL 33756

(727) 464-4331

alloyd@pinellascounty.org

From: Lanford, Caroline <clanford@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Sent: Wednesday, October 6, 2021 11:38 AM

To: Lloyd, Abigail <alloyd@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Ferguson, Alexis <aferguson@co.pinellas.fl.us>
Cc: Williams, Kimberly <kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Brown, Andrew W
<awbrown@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Subject: RE: Grants - Intent to Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Complete Streets Program

See below highlighted in green. Let me know if | missed anything.

Caroline Lanford, AICP CTP
Principal Planner

Pinellas County Planning

310 Court Street

Clearwater, Florida 33756
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Phone: 727.464.4356
clanford@pinellascounty.org

(tell us how we are doing!)
www.pinellascounty.org/surveys/plan

From: Lloyd, Abigail <alloyd@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Sent: Wednesday, October 6, 2021 11:29 AM

To: Ferguson, Alexis <aferguson@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Lanford, Caroline <clanford@co.pinellas.fl.us>
Cc: Williams, Kimberly <kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Brown, Andrew W

<awbrown@co.pinellas.fl.us>
Subject: RE: Grants - Intent to Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Complete Streets Program

Hi Caroline and Alexis —
Can you answer the highlighted questions below?

Also, you have listed Andrew as the analyst for this department, will this be an operating project or a
capital project?

Thanks!

Abigail Lloyd

Budget & Financial Management Analyst
Pinellas County Office of Management & Budget
14 S. Fort Harrison Ave., 5th Floor

Clearwater, FL 33756

(727) 464-4331

alloyd@pinellascounty.org

From: Grants Center of Excellence <no-reply@sharepointonline.com>
Sent: Tuesday, October 5, 2021 5:00 PM

To: Lloyd, Abigail <alloyd@co.pinellas.fl.us>
Subject: Grants - Intent to Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Complete Streets Program

O Complete Streets Program has been added

Ferguson, Alexis

10/5/2021 4:58 PM

Program Manager: Lanford, Caroline
Program Manager Phone #: 727 464.5647
County Department: Planning (includes Community Revitalization)

Director's Name: Stricklin, Carol L
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Application Submitter: Lanford, Caroline

OMB Analyst (CIP or Operating): Brown, Andrew W
Granting Agency: Forward Pinellas (Pinellas County MPO)
CFDA/CSFA #:

Grant Funding Program Name: Complete Streets Program
Grant Funding Type: Project

Grant Award Type: Reimbursement

Grant Funding Program Funding Cap ($):
$100,000
Amount Requested: $50,000.00

What fiscal year(s) will the award amount be made available?:
FY 2022

Match Amount:

Required Match Type:

Anticipated Match Source (Fund/Center/Program):
Is the Match in the Current Budget?:

Will the Match need to be added to the Budget?:

Total Cost of Project (including Grant, County match, and other Resources):

Estimated $100,000, balance of match to be provided by in kind services
from County staff and resources

Granting Agency Contact Name: Angela Ryan

Granting Agency Phone or Email: aryan@forwardpinellas.org

Granting Agency Address: 310 Court Street

Clearwater, FL 33756

OPUS Project Title:

Duration: Multi Year

Proposed The Planning Division in cooperation with Public Works

Abstract Transportation Planning and the City of Largo are

(Project requesting permission to develop an application for a grant

Scope of .

Work): request for the F or.ward Plnellgs Complete .Streets Program
for Concept Planning and Design to make improvements to
Whitney Road between US 19 and Bolesta Road. The
existing roadway is a two-lane, two-way rural section with
discontinuous sidewalks and no dedicated cyclist facilities.
This project will develop conceptual corridor enhancements
to support on-going residential growth, bolster economic
development, increase safety for all users, improve access
to services for vulnerable individuals, enhance the public


mailto:aryan@forwardpinellas.org

realm, and provide more efficient connections between
residences, schools, parks, public transportation, and
businesses. The concepts developed in this effort will be
further refined in the design process for implementation.

Projects such as these are vital to sustain existing and future
development and will serve as a catalyst for positive change
and private investment, ultimately increasing quality of life
for all residents. Complete Streets are strongly aligned with
our goals of connecting people to quality affordable
housing, employment, education, and transit services. This
project also aligns with Pinellas County Strategic Plan goals
and objectives to:

e Enhance pedestrian and bicycle safety;

e Proactively attract and retain businesses with targeted jobs to the

county and the region;
® |nvest in communities that need the most; and

e Deliver first class services to the public and our customers.

Benefit The Complete Streets Program provides opportunities for transformative
Summary |and use changes by creating opportunities for walkable, bikeable and
(How will  more livable communities. If selected for funding, the project aligns with

this benefit the County's strategic plan goals to: enhance bicyclist and pedestrian
the County, safety; invest in communities that need that most; invest in infrastructure
Dept, etc?): to meet current and future needs.

Director Approval (Attach):

Is the proposal submitted for a different Department?: No

If submitting for a different department, what is that department name?:
Concept Paper Deadline (if applicable):

Grant Application Due Date:

Source of Notification of Grant Solicitation: Administering Agency

If Other, provide source:

FOR OMB USE ONLY BELOW THIS  **PLEASE DO NOT ENTER DATA BELOW THIS
LINE: LINE**

Assigned To:

Priority: (2) Normal
Task Status: Not Started
OPUS Project #:

Grant Contract #:
Award Amount:

Grant Status: Submitted to OMB



Grant Start Date:
Grant End Date:
OMB Comments:
Granicus #:

Description:

Modify my alert settings | View Grants Database
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