Fechter, David D

From: Erica Richards <Erica.Richards@swfwmd.state.fl.us>

Sent: Wednesday, November 13, 2019 8:33 AM

To: Fechter, David D

Cc: Mackesey, Brendan; Bawany, Nabil

Subject: RE: Agreement No. 20CF0002707 - Section 10 Indemnification

This message has originated from Outside of the Organization. Do Not Click on links or open attachments unless you
are expecting the correspondence from the sender and know the content is safe.

Dave,

The District is not willing to remove Section 10 of the above-referenced agreement. It is a standard clause that is
included for all of our Cooperators.

Thank you,

Erica E. Richards

Senior Attorney

Southwest Florida Water Management District
7601 US 301 North

Tampa, Florida 33637

813.985.7481 ext. 4651

From: Fechter, David D <ddfechter@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Sent: Tuesday, November 12, 2019 11:30 AM

To: Erica Richards <Erica.Richards@swfwmd.state.fl.us>

Cc: Mackesey, Brendan <bmackesey@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Bawany, Nabil <nbawany@co.pinellas.fl.us>
Subject: FW: Agreement No. 20CF0002707 - Section 10 Indemnification

Hi Erica — Just a reminder | will need a statement from you (via email) unless SWFWMD is willing to move Section 10 of
the attached agreement. Please forward to me. Thanks.

Dave

David D. Fechter, AICP, CPPB
Department Administrative Manager
Public Works Department

14 S Fort Harrison Avenue, 4th Floor
Clearwater, Florida 33756
727-464-3019

From: Fechter, David D

Sent: Friday, November 08, 2019 12:27 PM

To: erica.richards@swfwmd.state.fl.us

Cc: Mackesey, Brendan <bmackesey@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Bawany, Nabil <nbawany@co.pinellas.fl.us>
Subject: Agreement No. 20CF0002707 - Section 10 Indemnification

Hi Erica — Please see attached. Unless the District is willing to remove Section 10 of the Klosterman Bayou WMP
Cooperative Funding Agreement, please send me a email similar to the attached email example stating such. Thanks.



Dave

David D. Fechter, AICP, CPPB
Department Administrative Manager
Public Works Department

14 S Fort Harrison Avenue, 4th Floor
Clearwater, Florida 33756
727-464-3019



