
Aehle, Yvette M 

From: Burbridge, Katherine A 
Sent: 

To: 

Monday, August 27, 2018 2:38 PM 
Aehle, Yvette M 

Cc: Jewsbury, Thomas R.; Mitchell, Erica; Ettel, Veronica E 
Subject: RE: Grants - Intent to Apply Submitted to 0MB - Airport Improvement Program 

0MB has no objection to the department submitting a grant application to the US Department of Transportation, 
Federal Aviation Administration to obtain funding for construction of new GA Taxiways and Roads at the airport, CIP 
000034A. 

Requested funding is $9M from the Airport Improvement Program's supplemental "Grants-In-Aid for Airports" 
discretionary appropriation made available July 2018. A $1M County match is required. The source of the match is the 
Airport Operation and Revenue Fund Reserves. The total project cost is $10M. The project (000034A) is in the Proposed 
FY19 County Capital Improvement program for the fiscal years 2023 and 2024. lf funds are awarded, the project can 
move forward and newly anticipated cost increases will be covered. 

The Board of County Commissioners signs off on this application. Please include this email when you send the 
application through Granicus for contract review and Board Agenda. 

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me. 

Katherine Burbridge, AICP, LEED AP 
Pinellas County Office of Management and Budget 
(727} 453-3457 
kburbridge@pinellascounty.org 
All government correspondence is subject to the public records law. 

Your opinion matters to us! Please take a moment to answer a brief survey about our service: 
www.pinellascounty.org/surveys/OMB 

From: Grants Center of Excellence [mailto:no-reply@sharepointonline.com] 
Sent: Friday, August 24, 2018 3:07 PM 
To: Burbridge, Katherine A <kburbridge@co.pinellas.fl.us> 
Subject: Grants - Intent to Apply Submitted to 0MB -Airport Improvement Program 

D Airport Improvement Program has heen added 

Aehle, Yvette M 
8.12Ll/2018 3:05 P'..1 

Program Manager: Aehle, Yvette M 

Program Manager Phone#: 7274537804

County Department: Airport 

Director's Name: Jewsbury, Thomas R. 
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0MB Analyst: Mitchell, Erica 

Granting Agency: Federal Aviation Administration 

CFDA/CSFA #: 20.106 

Grant Funding Program Name: Airport Improvement Program 

Grant Funding Type: Other 

Grant Award Type: Reimbursement 

Grant Funding Program Funding Cap ($): $100,000,000.00 

Amount Requested: $9,000,000.00 

What fiscal year(s) will the award amount be made available?: FY20 

Match Amount: $1,000,000.00 

Required Match Type: Cash 

Anticipated Match Source (Fund/Center/Program): 

Is the Match in the Current Budget?: No 

Will the Match need to be added to the Budget?: Yes 

Total Cost of Project (including Grant, County match, and other Resources): $10,000,000.00 

Granting Agency Contact Name: Jennifer Ganley 

Granting Agency Phone or Email: 407-487-7237 

Granting Agency Address: FAA Airports District Office 

SouthPark Building 

8427 South Park Circle, Suite 524 

Orlando, FL 32819 

OPUS Project Title: Construct New GA Taxiways and Roads (000034A) 

Duration: Single Year 

Proposed Abstract (Project 

Scope of Work): 

Design and construction of parallel taxiway(s}, roads, and ramp necessary 

to serve the Airco site's aeronautical tenants. 

Benefit Summary (How 

will this benefit the 

County, Dept. etc?): 

Airco and its associated aeronautical tenant(s) will enhance the long-term 

economic sustainability of the airport. These various pavements will make it 

easier for those tenant(s) to get on the airfield and to save time getting on 

and off the airfield. 

Director Approval (Attach): 

Is the proposal submitted for a different Department?: No 
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If submitting for a different department, what is that department name?: 

Concept Paper Deadline (if applicable): 10/31/2018 

Grant Application Due Date: 10/31/2018 

Source of Notification of Grant Solicitation: Administering Agency 

If Other, provide source: 

FOR 0MB USE ONLY BELOW THIS UNE: **PLEASE DO NOT ENTER DATA BELOW THIS LINE** 

Assigned To: 

Priority: (2) Normal 

Task Status: Not Started 

OPUS Project #:

Grant Contract #:

Award Amount: 

Grant Status: Submitted to 0MB 

Grant Start Date: 

Grant End Date: 

0MB 

Comments: 

Per email 8-27-2018 from V. Aehle, the total project cost is $10M with $1M match. 

Accepted 8-27-2-18 kb. 

Granicus #:

Description: 

Modify my alert settings View Grants Database 
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