PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
Tabulation
Bid No.: 167-0390-B(PF)
Bid Title : Road and Landscape Material (Coop) - Rebid
Date & Time Due: June 8, 2017 @ 3:00 PM
Wholesale
Landscape Supply Florida Dirt SLM Stan Weeks & Transcor
dba Big Earth Source Associates, Inc. | Recycling, LLC
Landscape Supply
Itl\i;n Description Amount Amount Amount Amount Amount
1 |Clay, Red (Item 1) $ 36,300.00 | $ 28,721.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 |Mulch, Cypress (Item 2) $ 2,645.00 | $ 2,409.25 | $ 2,911.80 No Bid No Bid
3 [Topsoil (Item 3) $ 1,650.00 | $ 2,304.50 | $ 2,381.50 No Bid No Bid
4 |Sand, Beach (ltem 4) $ 28,743.00 | $ 26,631.00 | $ 34,595.00 | $ 22,363.00 No Bid
5 |Sand, Masonry (Meeting FDOT | ¢ 39,053.25 | $ 2599725 | $  32,079.00 No Bid $  45708.75
Specifications) (Item 5)
6 |Sand, White Diamond (Item 6) $ 118,293.75 | $ 84,821.00 [ $ 115,665.00 No Bid No Bid
Sand, Silica for Underdrain . .
7 (FDOT Specification) (Item 7) $ 135.00 | $ 187.50 No Bid No Bid $ 194.75
Limestone, Crushed (Size 57) .
8 (FDOT Specification) (Item 8) $ 107,100.00 | $ 93,177.00 | $ 155,937.60 No Bid $ 105,570.00
Limestone, Crushed (Size 89) .
9 (FDOT Specification) (Item 9) $ 141,094.80 | $ 120,582.00 | $ 201,801.60 No Bid $ 136,620.00
Roadway Base, Recycled Crushed
10 |[Concrete/Graded Aggregate $ 52,875.00 | $ 42,300.00 | $ 54,990.00 No Bid $ 66,035.00
(EDOT) (Item 10V
Concrete, Recycled (Item 11) .
11 | Size #57. Stone) (1/2” - 17) $ 5,000.00 | $ 6,220.00 | $ 8,320.00 No Bid $ 7,120.00
Granite (Size #89, 3/8") (Meeting . .
12 FDOT Specification) (Item 12) $ 720.00 | $ 491.40 | $ 770.00 No Bid No Bid
Limerock Base Coarse Material, 3 . . .
13 1/2" Sieve & Down (FDOT No Bid $ 957.50 | $ 1,875.00 No Bid No Bid
Granite (Size #57, 1) (FDOT ] ]
14 |specification) (Item 14) $ 720.00 | $ 471.40 | $ 770.00 No Bid No Bid
Shell, Oyster: Medium 1" - 2", .
15 Washed (Item 15) $ 5,863.20 [ $ 5,880.00 | $ 8,050.00 | $ 5,177.20 No Bid
16 [Shell, Oyster: Small, 1%, Washed f ¢ 2995650 | $ 2835000 | $ 3948750 | $  26,426.25 No Bid
Iltem (11) (Item 16)
17 |Shell: Bank Run (Meeting FDOT f ¢ 33,611.00 | $  30,450.00 | $  66,70000 | $  26,868.50 No Bid
Specification) (Item 17)
18 :Tt'epr:ig)'aedd'"g Stone 67-12 $ 3,872.40 | $ 6,195.00 | $ 6,825.00 No Bid $ 5,670.00
19 :Tt'eprfig; Ditch Lining 127-24 $ 544440 | $  7,670.00 | $ 8,450.00 No Bid $ 7,540.00
Delivery Fee for orders below 20
20 Tons or 15 CY (Item 20) $ 325.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 325.00| $ 1,250.00 || $ 275.00
Total Bid - Five (5) Years | $3,069,011.50 $2,611,579.00 | $3,759,670.00 | $ 460,424.75 || $1,923,667.50
Awarded Amount $ 80,509.00 | $1,999,639.00 $ 404,174.75
Unspecified Funds $ 2,000.00 | $ 40,000.00 $ 8,000.00
Joual Awarded Amount-FIve ) g 2,500.00 | $2,039,639.00 $ 412,174.75
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