PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
Tabulation
Bid No.: 167-0156-B(PF)
Bid Title: |Mosquito Abatement Products
Date & Time|February 2, 2017 at 3PM
Blank unit price means no bid ADAPCO, LLC CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS VALENT BIOSCIENCES
Product . Product & Product & Product & Product & o
No. Description Manufacturer Amount Manufacturer Amount Maunfacturer Amount Maunfacturer Unit Price
-Di - -di i 0,
1 1,2 Dibromo-2,2-dichloroethyl dimethyl phosphate Naled 87.4% No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Dibrom® concentrate)
5 gizﬂgg thuringiensis subspecies israelensis Bti (Bactimos $ 848.00 $ 848.00 - No Bid
3 Piperonyl butoxide and permethrin (Biomist® 31+66 ULV) $ 69.707.00 No Bid
3 approved equal |$  47,052.50 | $  48,130.50
4 White Mineral Oil (10% w/w) (CocoBear™) No Bid $ 6,474.00 No Bid
4 Or Equal [$  2,985.00]
5 Piperonyl butoxide, phenothrin, prallethrin (Duet®) No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 Spinosad (mix of spinosyn A and spinosyn D) (Natular™ G) No Bid No Bid No Bid
. . - - ™
7 Spinosad (mix of spinosyn A and spinosyn D) (Natular™ G30) No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Extended Release Granule)
8 Spinosad (mix of spinosyn A & spinosyn D) (Natular™ T30) No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 Spinosad (mix of spinosyn A & spinosyn D) (Natular™ XRT) No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 Spinosad (mix of spinosyn A & spinosyn D) (Natular™ DT) No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 |S-Methoprene 4.25% (MetalLarv® S-PT) No Bid No Bid [$  170,880.00 |
Bacillus thuringiensis subsp israelensis strain AM 65-52 . .
12 (Vectobac® GS) No Bid No Bid
Bacillus thuringiensis subsp israelensis strain AM 65-52 . . .
13 (Vectobac® WDG) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bacillus sphaericus Serotype H5a5b strain 2362 . )
14 (Vectolex® FG) No Bid No Bid
14 EQUAL NOT ACCPETED BY PUBLIC WORKS |SPHTX50CG-40 | $ 208,350.00
Bacillus sphaericus 2362, serotype H5a5b, strain ABTS 1743 . .
15 (Vectolex® WSP) $ 2,400.00 No Bid No Bid
15 SPTXWSP-800 [ISI 227001
Bacillus sphaericus 2362, Serotype H5a5b, strain ABTS 1743
16 2.7%; Bacillus thuringiensis Subsp. israelensis Serotype H-14 |No Bid No Bid No Bid
Strain AM65-52 4.5% (VectoMax® FG)
Bacillus thuringiensis subsp. Israelensis, strain AM 65-52 . . .
17 6.07%, methoprenel0% (VectoPrime® FG) No Bid No Bid No Bid _
Bacillus sphaericus 2362, serotype H5a5b, strain ABTS 1743 . . .
18 (VectoMax WSP) No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 Deltamethrin 2.0%, a Type |l pyrethroid. (DeltaGard®) No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 Methoprene 2.1% (Altosid® XR Briguettes) $ 2,131.80 $ 2,131.80 No Bid No Bid
21 Methoprene 8.62% (Altosid® 30-Day Briguettes) $ 5,376.00 $ 5,376.00 No Bid No Bid
22 Methoprene 1.5% (Altosid® XR-G) $ 50,700.00 $ 50,700.00 No Bid No Bid
23 Methoprene .2% (Altosid® SBG) $ 146,880.00 $ 146,880.00 No Bid No Bid
Annual Total Bid $ 480,063.10 $ 1,301,960.70 $ 51,814.00 $ 289,380.00
Five year Total Bid $ 2,400,315.50 $ 6,509,803.50 $ 259,070.00 $ 1,446,900.00
Items 5-10, 12-14,
Items 1, 3, 15, 19 16, 18 Iltems 2 and 4 Iltems 11 and 17
Annual Award Amount $ 65,777.30 $ 1,017,443.90 $ 3,683.50 $ 289,380.00
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PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA

Tabulation

Bid No..  |167-0156-B(PF)

Bid Title: |Mosquito Abatement Products

Date & Time|February 2, 2017 at 3PM

Blank unit price means no bid ADAPCO, LLC CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS VALENT BIOSCIENCES
Product - Product & Product & Product & Product & . .
No. Description Manufacturer Amount Manufacturer Amount Maunfacturer Amount Maunfacturer Unit Price
Five year Award Amount $ 328,886.50 $ 5,087,219.50 $ 18,417.50 $ 1,446,900.00
Iltems 20 -23 - Annual Award Amount $ 205,087.80
Items 20 -23 - Five year Award Amount $ 1,025,439.00
Unspecified Amount - Five years| $ 50,000.00
Tie bid 20 -23
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