From: Williams, Kimberly <kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Sent: Monday, August 30, 2021 3:33 PM

To: Menke, Tom <tmenke@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Ross, Megan E<mross@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Mitchell, Erica
<emitchell@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Ettel, Veronica E<vettel@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Cc: Grants Center Of Excellence Distribution <GrantsCOE@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Subject: Funding Source Correction: Grants - Intentto Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Resilient Florida

Good afternoon,

The approved Intentto Apply forthe Resilient Florida Program to perform structural hardening of four Pinellas County
Utility Buildings — Logan Laboratory, South Cross Bayou Operations, General Maintenance Division South, and South
Cross Bayou Dewatering Operations has been updated toreflect the correct funding source for matching funds (F4034
and F4052). Please include the updated email when you send your application.

Sincerely,

Kimberly Y. Williams

Budget & Financial Management Analyst

Pinellas County Office of Management & Budget

14 S. Ft. Harrison Avenue - 5th FL, Clearwater, FL 33756
(727) 464-3507

kwilliams @co.pinellas.fl.us

From: Williams, Kimberly

Sent: Monday, August 30, 2021 3:13 PM

To: Menke, Tom <tmenke@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Ross, Megan E<mross@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Mitchell, Erica
<emitchell@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Ettel, Veronica E<vettel@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Cc: Grants Center Of Excellence Distribution <GrantsCOE@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Subject: RE: Grants - Intentto Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Resilient Florida

Greetings!

OMB has no objection to the Utilities Department submitting a grant application to the Florida Department of
Environmental Protection’s Resilient Florida Program to perform structural hardening of four Pinellas County Utility
Buildings — Logan Laboratory, South Cross Bayou Operations, General Maintenance Division South, and South Cross
Bayou Dewatering Operations.

This is a multi-yearreimbursement grant project that will potentiallyimpact FY22-FY26. The requested funding is
$3,600,000.00 with an in-kind match in the amount of $5,400,000.00. The fundingsource for matching funds has been
identified by the department as F4034 and F4052. The total projectis estimated to cost $9,000,000.00.

This grant application will require approvalfrom the Board of County Commissioners. Please include this email whenyou
send the application through Granicus. The review shall include the Director, Assistant County Administrator, and
County Administrator along with any others as defined in Granicus/Legistar standard operating procedures.

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Sincerely,

Kimberly Y. Williams
Budget & Financial Management Analyst
Pinellas County Office of Management & Budget
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14 S. Ft. Harrison Avenue - 5th FL, Clearwater, FL 33756
(727) 464-3507
kwilliams @co.pinellas.fl.us

From: Grants Center of Excellence <no-reply@sharepointonline.com>
Sent: Monday, August 30, 2021 8:15 AM

To: Williams, Kimberly <kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Subject: Grants - Intentto Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Resilient Florida

[0 Resiliant Florida has been added

Menke, Tom
8/30/2021 8:14 AM

Program Manager: Menke, Tom

Program Manager Phone #: 7274533611

County Department: Utilities (Water and Sewer)

Director's Name: megan ross

OMB Analyst: Mitchell, Erica

Granting Agency: Florida Department of Environmental Protection

CFDA/CSFA #:

Grant Funding Program Name: Resilient Florida

Grant Funding Type: Capital

Grant Award Type: Reimbursement

Grant Funding Program Funding Cap ($):

Amount Requested: $3,600,000.00

What fiscal year(s) will the award amount be made available?: Fy'2022

Match Amount: $5,400,000.00

Required Match Type: Cash

Anticipated Match Source (Fund/Center/Program): Enterprise/Sewer Fund

Is the Match in the Current Budget?: Yes

Will the Match need to be added to the Budget?: No

Total Cost of Project (including Grant, County match, and other Resources): $9,000,000.00
Granting Agency Contact Name: Florida Department of Environmental Protection

Granting Agency Phone or Email: Whitney.Gray@ FloridaDEP.gov; 850-245-2098

Granting Agency Address:
OPUS Project Title:

Duration: Multi Year
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Proposed Abstract (Project Scope of Work): Hardening of 4-Pinellas County Utilities buildings
1.) Logan Laboratory (Opus# 002149A)
2.) South Cross Bayou Operations
3.) General Maintenance Division South (Opus# 004578A)

4.) South Cross Bayou Dewatering Operations

Benefit Summary (How  Utilities operations staff will be staged in these facilities during hurricane
will this benefit the related events so they may commence into emergency operations immediately
County, Dept, etc?): post storm. This project is being done for the safety of the workers.

Director Approval (Attach): No

Is the proposal submitted for a different Department?: No

If submitting for a different department, what is that department name?:
Concept Paper Deadline (if applicable):

Grant Application Due Date: 9/1/2021

Source of Notification of Grant Solicitation: Administering Agency

If Other, provide source:

FOR OMB USE ONLY BELOW THIS LINE: **PLEASE DO NOT ENTER DATA BELOW THIS LINE**
Assigned To:

Priority: (2) Normal

Task Status: Not Started

OPUS Project #:

Grant Contract #:

Award Amount:

Grant Status: Submitted to OMB

Grant Start Date:

Grant End Date:

OMB Comments:

Granicus #:

Description:

Modify my alert settings ' View Grants Database
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From: Williams, Kimberly <kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Sent: Monday, August 30, 2021 2:54 PM

To: Bay, Guillermo <bbay@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Ross, Megan E<mross@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Mitchell, Erica
<emitchell@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Ettel, Veronica E<vettel@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Cc: Grants Center Of Excellence Distribution <GrantsCOE@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Subject: RE: Grants - Intentto Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Resiliant Florida

Greetings!

OMB has no objection to the Utilities Department submitting a grant application to the Florida Department of
Environmental Protection’s Resilient Florida Program to upgrade Pinellas Park’s existinglift station to eliminate
overflow duringwet weatherevents.

This is a multi-year reimbursement grant project that will potentially impact FY23-FY27. The requested fundingis
$5,200,000.00 with an in-kind match in the amount of $7,800,000.00. The fundingsource for matching funds has been
identified by the departmentas Fund 4052. The total projectis estimated to cost $13,000,000.00.

This grant application will require approvalfrom the Board of County Commissioners. Please include this email when you
send the application through Granicus. The review shall include the Director, Assistant County Administrator, and
County Administrator along with any others as defined in Granicus/Legistar standard operating procedures.

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Sincerely,

Kimberly Y. Williams

Budget & Financial Management Analyst

Pinellas County Office of Management & Budget

14 S. Ft. Harrison Avenue - 5th FL, Clearwater, FL 33756
(727) 464-3507

kwilliams @co.pinellas.fl.us

From: Grants Center of Excellence <no-reply@sharepointonline.com>
Sent: Monday, August 30, 2021 8:29 AM

To: Williams, Kimberly <kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Subject: Grants - Intentto Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Resiliant Florida

[0 Resiliant Florida has been added

Menke, Tom
8/30/2021 8:28 AM

Program Manager: Bay, Guillermo
Program Manager Phone #: 4644220
County Department: Utilities (Water and Sewer)

Director's Name: Ross, Megan E
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OMB Analyst: Mitchell, Erica

Granting Agency: Florida Department of Environmental Protection
CFDA/CSFA #:

Grant Funding Program Name: Resilient Florida

Grant Funding Type: Capital

Grant Award Type: Reimbursement

Grant Funding Program Funding Cap ($):

Amount Requested: $5,200,000.00

What fiscal year(s) will the award amount be made available?: FY2023
Match Amount: $7,800,000.00

Required Match Type: Cash

Anticipated Match Source (Fund/Center/Program): Enterprise/Sewer Fund
Is the Match in the Current Budget?: Yes

Will the Match need to be added to the Budget?: No

Total Cost of Project (including Grant, County match, and other Resources): $13,000,000.00
Granting Agency Contact Name: Whitney Gray

Granting Agency Phone or Email: Whitney.Gray@ FloridaDEP.gov

Granting Agency Address:
OPUS Project Title: Pinellas Park Interceptor Collection System Improvements - 003147A
Duration: Multi Year

Proposed Abstract Construct a sanitary sewer forced main from Pinellas Park master lift station to the
(Project Scope of  South Cross Bayou Advanced water reclaimation facility. Upgrade Pinellas Park lift

Work): station to meet the new hydraulic conditions caused by the new forced main.
Benefit Summary This project will eliminate a repetitive sanitary sewer overflow occuringin Pinellas
(How will this benefit Park, Florida during wet weather events. These overflows contain raw sewage, so
the County, Dept, this project willl protect water quality and the environment while enhancing the
etc?): resiliancy of Pinellas County's wastewater systems.

Director Approval (Attach): No

Is the proposal submitted for a different Department?: No

If submitting for a different department, what is that department name?:
Concept Paper Deadline (if applicable):

Grant Application Due Date: 9/1/2021

Source of Notification of Grant Solicitation: Administering Agency

If Other, provide source:

FOR OMB USE ONLY BELOW THIS LINE: **PLEASE DO NOT ENTER DATA BELOW THIS LINE**


mailto:Whitney.Gray@FloridaDEP.gov

Assigned To:

Priority: (2) Normal
Task Status: Not Started
OPUS Project #:

Grant Contract #:
Award Amount:

Grant Status: Submitted to OMB
Grant Start Date:
Grant End Date:

OMB Comments:
Granicus #:

Description:

Modify my alert settings = View Grants Database

—

From: Williams, Kimberly <kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Sent: Monday, August 30, 2021 3:42 PM

To: Osmanski, Craig <cosmanski@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Ross, Megan E<mross@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Mitchell, Erica
<emitchell@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Ettel, Veronica E<vettel@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Cc: Grants Center Of Excellence Distribution <GrantsCOE@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Subject: RE: Grants - Intentto Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Resilient Florida

Greetings!

OMB has no objection to the Utilities Department submitting a grant application to the Florida Department of
Environmental Protection’s Resilient Florida Program to improve electrical delivery systems in the WE Dunn Water
Reclamation Facility.

This is a single year reimbursement grant project that will potentiallyimpact FY23. The requested fundingis
$3,600,000.00 with an in-kind match in the amount of $5,400,000.00. The fundingsource for matching funds has been
identified by the departmentas Fund 4052. The total projectis estimated to cost $9,000,000.00.

This grant application will require approvalfrom the Board of County Commissioners. Please include this email when you
send the application through Granicus. The review shall include the Director, Assistant County Administrator, and
County Administrator along with any others as defined in Granicus/Legistar standard operating procedures.

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Sincerely,


https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fpinellasgov.sharepoint.com%2Fsites%2FBCCIntra%2FGrants%2F_layouts%2F15%2FMySubs.aspx&data=04%7C01%7Cjobrown%40co.pinellas.fl.us%7C2c26e4a3ca564f59feb408d96ca0b030%7Cc32ee18fa4c746ffaf408ed605642745%7C0%7C0%7C637660259661768504%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=uRiQyinejaxRY0xUh75MiWZlGx6aLKkec4A%2FuNbPuFo%3D&reserved=0
https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fpinellasgov.sharepoint.com%2Fsites%2FBCCIntra%2FGrants%2FLists%2FTasks&data=04%7C01%7Cjobrown%40co.pinellas.fl.us%7C2c26e4a3ca564f59feb408d96ca0b030%7Cc32ee18fa4c746ffaf408ed605642745%7C0%7C0%7C637660259661768504%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=BbJWf%2Fa7sEvMEreMeofgGtAY0iEmkQJB3lqgFMArxkY%3D&reserved=0
mailto:kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us
mailto:cosmanski@co.pinellas.fl.us
mailto:mross@co.pinellas.fl.us
mailto:emitchell@co.pinellas.fl.us
mailto:vettel@co.pinellas.fl.us
mailto:GrantsCOE@co.pinellas.fl.us

Kimberly Y. Williams

Budget & Financial Management Analyst

Pinellas County Office of Management & Budget

14 S. Ft. Harrison Avenue - 5th FL, Clearwater, FL 33756
(727) 464-3507

kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us

From: Grants Center of Excellence <no-reply@sharepointonline.com>
Sent: Monday, August 30, 2021 8:42 AM

To: Williams, Kimberly <kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Subject: Grants - Intentto Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Resiliant Florida

[0 Resiliant Florida has been added

Menke, Tom
8/30/2021 8:41 AM

Program Manager: Osmanski, Craig

Program Manager Phone #: 4644220

County Department: Utilities (Water and Sewer)

Director's Name: Ross, Megan E

OMB Analyst: Mitchell, Erica

Granting Agency: Florida Department of Environmental Protection
CFDA/CSFA #:

Grant Funding Program Name: Resiliant Florida

Grant Funding Type: Capital

Grant Award Type: Reimbursement

Grant Funding Program Funding Cap ($):

Amount Requested: $3,600,000.00

What fiscal year(s) will the award amount be made available?: FY2023
Match Amount: $5,400,000.00

Required Match Type: Cash

Anticipated Match Source (Fund/Center/Program): Enterprise/Sewer FUnd
Is the Match in the Current Budget?: Yes

Will the Match need to be added to the Budget?: No

Total Cost of Project (including Grant, County match, and other Resources): $9,000,000.00
Granting Agency Contact Name: Whitney Gray

Granting Agency Phone or Email: Whitney.Gray@ FloridaDEP.gov

Granting Agency Address:

OPUS Project Title: 003409A-Dunn Electrical Upgrades
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Duration: Single Year

Proposed Abstract (Project Improve electrical delivery system to the WE Dunn Water Reclaimation
Scope of Work): Facility. New electrical gear, generators, switches, etc.

Benefit Summary (How will this benefit the  Project will upgrade equipment and improve resiliance
County, Dept, etc?): related to storm outages.

Director Approval (Attach): No

Is the proposal submitted for a different Department?: No

If submitting for a different department, what is that department name?:
Concept Paper Deadline (if applicable):

Grant Application Due Date: 9/1/2021

Source of Notification of Grant Solicitation: Administering Agency

If Other, provide source:

FOR OMB USE ONLY BELOW THIS LINE: **PLEASE DO NOT ENTER DATA BELOW THIS LINE**
Assigned To:

Priority: (2) Normal

Task Status: Not Started

OPUS Project #:

Grant Contract #:

Award Amount:

Grant Status: Submitted to OMB

Grant Start Date:

Grant End Date:

OMB Comments:

Granicus #:

Description:

Modify my alert settings ' View Grants Database

—

From: Williams, Kimberly <kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us>
Sent: Monday, August 30, 2021 3:53 PM
To: Menke, Tom <tmenke@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Ross, Megan E<mross@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Mitchell, Erica
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<emitchell@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Ettel, Veronica E<vettel@co.pinellas.fl.us>
Cc: Grants Center Of Excellence Distribution <GrantsCOE@co.pinellas.fl.us>
Subject: RE: Grants - Intentto Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Resilient Florida

Greetings!

OMB has no objection to the Utilities Department submitting a grant application to the Florida Department of
Environmental Protection’s Resilient Florida Program to install permanent bypass pumps or generators at 26 utility
owned wastewater pump stations.

This is a multi-yearreimbursement grant project that will potentially impact FY22-FY26. The requested fundingis
$2,100,000.00 with an in-kind match in the amount of $3,200,000.00. The fundingsource for matching funds has been
identified by the departmentas Fund 4052. The total projectis estimated to cost $5,300,000.00.

This grant application will require approvalfrom the Board of County Commissioners. Please include this email when you
send the application through Granicus. The review shall include the Director, Assistant County Administrator, and
County Administrator along with any others as defined in Granicus/Legistar standard operating procedures.

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Sincerely,

Kimberly Y. Williams

Budget & Financial Management Analyst

Pinellas County Office of Management & Budget

14 S. Ft. Harrison Avenue - 5th FL, Clearwater, FL 33756
(727) 464-3507

kwilliams @co.pinellas.fl.us

From: Grants Center of Excellence <no-reply@sharepointonline.com>
Sent: Monday, August 30, 2021 12:11 PM

To: Williams, Kimberly <kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Subject: Grants - Intentto Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Resilient Florida

[1 Resilient Florida has been added

Glaser, Daniel
8/30/202112:10 PM

Program Manager: Menke, Tom

Program Manager Phone #: 7274533611
County Department: Utilities (Water and Sewer)
Director's Name: Ross, Megan E

OMB Analyst: Collins, Fredricka

Granting Agency: FDEP

CFDA/CSFA #:

Grant Funding Program Name: Resilient Florida
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Grant Funding Type: Capital

Grant Award Type: Reimbursement

Grant Funding Program Funding Cap ($):

Amount Requested: $2,100,000.00

What fiscal year(s) will the award amount be made available?: 2022
Match Amount: $3,200,000.00

Required Match Type: In-kind

Anticipated Match Source (Fund/Center/Program): Sewer Fund

Is the Match in the Current Budget?: Yes

Will the Match need to be added to the Budget?:

Total Cost of Project (including Grant, County match, and other Resources):
Granting Agency Contact Name:

Granting Agency Phone or Email:

Granting Agency Address:

OPUS Project Title: PS Generator improvements

Duration: Multi Year

Proposed Abstract (Project Scope Install permanent bypass pumps or generators at 26 Utilities' owned

of Work): wastewater pump stations.
Benefit Summary (How will this benefit the This project will result in resilient pump stations during
County, Dept, etc?): power outages.

Director Approval (Attach):

Is the proposal submitted for a different Department?: No

If submitting for a different department, what is that department name?:
Concept Paper Deadline (if applicable):

Grant Application Due Date:

Source of Notification of Grant Solicitation: Administering Agency

If Other, provide source:

FOR OMB USE ONLY BELOW THIS LINE: **PLEASE DO NOT ENTER DATA BELOW THIS LINE**
Assigned To:

Priority: (2) Normal

Task Status: Not Started

OPUS Project #: 003762A

Grant Contract #:

Award Amount:



Grant Status: Submitted to OMB
Grant Start Date:

Grant End Date:

OMB Comments:

Granicus #:

Description:

—

From: Williams, Kimberly <kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Sent: Tuesday, August 31, 2021 9:11 AM

To: Glaser, Daniel<dglaser@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Ross, Megan E<mross@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Mitchell, Erica
<emitchell@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Ettel, Veronica E<vettel@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Cc: Grants Center Of Excellence Distribution <GrantsCOE@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Subject: RE: Grants - Intentto Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Resilient Florida

Good morning!

OMB has no objection to the Utilities Department submitting a grant application to the Florida Department of
Environmental Protection’s Resilient Florida Program to replace or repair up to fifteen (15) mobile home park
wastewater collection systems in unincorporated southern Pinellas County.

This is a multi-year reimbursement grant project that will potentially impact FY24-FY26. The requested fundingis
$25,000,000.00 and no match fundsis required. The total projectis estimated to cost $25,000,000.00.

This grant application will require approvalfrom the Board of County Commissioners. Please include this email when you
send the application through Granicus. The review shall include the Director, Assistant County Administrator, and
County Administrator along with any others as defined in Granicus/Legistar standard operating procedures.

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Sincerely,

Kimberly Y. Williams

Budget & Financial Management Analyst

Pinellas County Office of Management & Budget

14 S. Ft. Harrison Avenue - 5th FL, Clearwater, FL 33756
(727) 464-3507

kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us

From: Grants Center of Excellence <no-reply@sharepointonline.com>
Sent: Monday, August 30, 2021 11:48 AM

To: Williams, Kimberly <kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us>

Subject: Grants - Intentto Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Resilient Florida



mailto:kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us
mailto:dglaser@co.pinellas.fl.us
mailto:mross@co.pinellas.fl.us
mailto:emitchell@co.pinellas.fl.us
mailto:vettel@co.pinellas.fl.us
mailto:GrantsCOE@co.pinellas.fl.us
mailto:kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us
mailto:no-reply@sharepointonline.com
mailto:kwilliams@co.pinellas.fl.us

[l Resilient Florida has been added

Glaser, Daniel
8/30/2021 11:46 AM

Program Manager: Glaser, Daniel

Program Manager Phone #: 7274645209

County Department: Utilities (Water and Sewer)
Director's Name: Ross, Megan E

OMB Analyst: Collins, Fredricka

Granting Agency: FDEP

CFDA/CSFA #:

Grant Funding Program Name: Resilient Florida
Grant Funding Type: Capital

Grant Award Type: Reimbursement

Grant Funding Program Funding Cap ($):

Amount Requested: $25,000,000.00

What fiscal year(s) will the award amount be made available?: 2024
Match Amount:

Required Match Type:

Anticipated Match Source (Fund/Center/Program):
Is the Match in the Current Budget?:

Will the Match need to be added to the Budget?:
Total Cost of Project (including Grant, County match, and other Resources):
Granting Agency Contact Name:

Granting Agency Phone or Email:

Granting Agency Address:

OPUS Project Title:

Duration: Multi Year

Proposed Abstract
(Project Scope of

Work): e The planned project, utilizing the RESTORE Act Grant for design, is to replace
or repair up to fifteen (15) mobile home park wastewater collection systems in
unincorporated southern Pinellas County.

e The project's primary goal is to reduce infiltration and inflow (I&1) that
contribute to sanitary sewer overflows (SSOs) and capacity issues in Pinellas
County Utilities' wastewater collection system, which contribute to surface
water discharge.

e This request is for construction only.


https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fpinellasgov.sharepoint.com%2Fsites%2FBCCIntra%2FGrants%2FLists%2FTasks%2FDispForm.aspx%3FID%3D374&data=04%7C01%7Cjobrown%40co.pinellas.fl.us%7C28ba289863f849f117d208d96ca080a0%7Cc32ee18fa4c746ffaf408ed605642745%7C0%7C0%7C637660258894213696%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=pQgYw22tfzNhKOznESaSBmoyECFc53WMVNrZPGvnayk%3D&reserved=0

Benefit Summary (How The benefit of this project will be a reduction in the contribution of infiltration and

will this benefit the inflow (1&I) that contributes to sanitary sewer overflows (SSOs) and capacity issues

County, Dept, etc?): in Pinellas County Utilities' wastewater collection system, and reduction in surface
water discharge.

Director Approval (Attach):

Is the proposal submitted for a different Department?: No

If submitting for a different department, what is that department name?: Utilities (Water and Sewer)
Concept Paper Deadline (if applicable):

Grant Application Due Date:

Source of Notification of Grant Solicitation: Administering Agency

If Other, provide source:

FOR OMB USE ONLY BELOW THIS LINE: **PLEASE DO NOT ENTER DATA BELOW THIS LINE**
Assigned To:

Priority: (2) Normal

Task Status: Not Started

OPUS Project #:

Grant Contract #:

Award Amount:

Grant Status: Submitted to OMB

Grant Start Date:

Grant End Date:

OMB Comments:

Granicus #:

Description:

Modify my alert settings = View Grants Database

—
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