
























































  
  

  

  

January 3, 2022 

  

  

  

  

  

To Whom It May Concern:  

  

  

This letter serves to confirm that Cocobear® larvicidal oil is exclusively manufactured by 

Clarke, labeled for Public Health mosquito control use. There is no like competitive product 

source in the U.S.    

 

Please let us know if we can be of further assistance.    

  

Cordially,   

  

  

Miranda Schield 

Director, Marketing  

  



6/NGK 
Insect Control utions 

December 16, 2021 

Dear Sir or Madam: 

This letter serves as confirmation that Clarke Mosquito Control is MGK's exclusive distributor 
for the following products in the United States for the year 2022: 

AquaDuetTM 
DUET™ 
DUET™HD 

EPA Reg. No. 1021-2562-8329 
EPA Reg. No. 1021-1795-8329 
EPA Reg. No. 8329-105 

These products contain proprietary active ingredient(s) and unique formulation technology that 
give the products superior performance. We have a long history of working with Clarke in this 
market. We find this arrangement gives us the best chance to reach customers with the support 
necessary to serve this market. Please let me know should you need further details. 

Sincerely, 

Merris Greiber 
Sr. Director of Marketing 

7325 Aspen Lnt 
Minneapolis. MM 55428 

800 845.0408 
t 783 544 0341 

WWW AGK OM 

Insect Control Solution 



 

 

---Internal Use---  

Corteva Agrisciences 
Agriculture Division of DowDuPont 
9330 Zionsville Road  Indianapolis, IN 46268  USA   Tel 317 337 4337    www.corteva.com 

 
 

 

December 8, 2021 

 

 

To whom it may concern, 
 

Please allow this letter to confirm that Corteva has granted Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. 

exclusive rights to market its active ingredient spinosad for mosquito larval control products in the US 

territories, Caribbean and Cayman Islands for 2022.  Corteva understands that spinosad is utilized in 

Clarke’s Natular G, Natular G30, Natular G30 WSP, Natular T30, Natular XRT, Natular 2EC, Natular SC, 

and Natular DT products. 

Please let me know if you need further details. 

Yours sincerely, 

 

Lisa Bostock 

Global Business Development Leader 

Corteva Agrisciences 

lisa.bostock@corteva.com 

317-670-4408 

 

 



Insec t Control Solutions 

December 16, 2021 

Dear Sir or Madam: 

This letter serves as confirmation that MGK has granted Clarke Mosquito Control an exclusive 
right to formulate and distribute its own products containing MGK's PyGanic® compound (EPA 
Reg. No. 1021-1805) in the United States' vector control market for the year 2022. The following 
is one example of a Clarke product containing MGK's PyGanic compound: 

MERUS™ 3.0 EPA Reg. No. 8329-108 

This product contains a proprietary active ingredient and unique formulation technology that 
gives the product superior performance. We have a long history of working with Clarke in this 
market. We find this arrangement gives us the best chance to reach customers with the support 
necessary to serve this market. Please let me know should you need further details. 

Sincerely, 

Merris Greiber 
Sr. Director of Marketing 

7325Aspen LnN 
Minne9polis, MN 55428 

800 845.04008 

1 763 544 0341 
WWW MGK OM 

Insect Control Solution 
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May 26, 2022 
 
Pinellas County Board of County Commissioners 
400 S. Ft. Harrison Avenue 
Annex Building – 6th Floor  
Clearwater, FL 33756 
 
Re: ITB22-0466-B, Mosquito Abatement Products – Section E 
 
Thank you for the opportunity to submit a response to ITB22-0466-B, Mosquito Abatement Products. Altosid products are 
part of an “Agency” pricing distribution agreement.  All “agents” must bid the same price for all products and must be 
approved agents.  The goal of this system is to allow the customer to select the agent that is providing the value-added 
services to the customer and industry.   
 
Clarke Mosquito Control Products would like to request Pinellas County BOCC to consider the following value-added 
services provided to the County:  
 

i. Contract Management: Pinellas County will have access to subject matter experts in regulatory, product 
development, equipment optimization, packaging and logistics, and product experts. Pinellas County will be 
assigned to a direct account manager, a customer care specialist, and a technical field staff member.  
 
Clarke has 160 full time employees dedicated to the vector control industry.  At least 25 employees will be 
involved in providing service to Pinellas County.  For this contract, key Clarke personnel from at least the following 
departments will participate in servicing this contract: 

 

• Sales:  Bobby Santana - Regional Sales Lead, Kim Dunn - FL Sales Coordinator, Mike Muldoon – VP of Domestic 
Sales, Frank Clarke – VP of Key Accounts 

• Supply Chain:  Mike Gaither – Director of Manufacturing and Supply Chain 

• Warehouse:  Jeff Larson - Supply Chain Manager, Andrew Gentes – Regional Operations Manager 

• Shipping:  Bill Gooch- Warehouse Supervisor, Crystal Challacombe - Kissimmee Office Manager 

• Research & Development:  Yemi Bullen-McClain - Product Development Director 

• Technical Support:  Derek Drews – Field Science Manager, Kattie Morris – Regional Field Science Supervisor, 
Victoria Hyrczyk – Associate Field Biologist, Madeline Schmitz – Associate Field Biologist  

 
ii. Delivery Response: For the past several years, Clarke has worked closely with the County to provide timely 

deliveries to ensure smooth, uninterrupted operations.  Since Clarke has a warehouse in Kissimmee, FL, we will 
work with the County staff to inventory certain products for quick delivery.  Often, shipments will arrive the next 
day due to local warehouse.  For the past several years, Clarke has been providing custom packaging for Altosid 
and Natular products that best fits the County’s operation and storage requirements.  An example is custom 
packaged 1,200 lb pallets instead of the standard 1,600 lb pallets.  This custom packaging best fits the County’s 
storage, inventory system and use patterns.   

 
iii. Product Safety Training: A minimum of Clarke’s Annual Workshop is dedicated to safety and regulatory training. 

Training is approved for 1 x core CEU Credit. Please see Clarke Workshop information for additional information.  
 
As part of our commitment to Pinellas County and industry stewardship, Clarke can provide a customized 4-6 
hour product safety training course for all of the Pinellas County Mosquito Control.  This course will be offered up 
to twice per year or as directed by Pinellas County Mosquito Control.  The course will provide DACS CEU credits 
for your staff.  The course will include: 
 



     
 
 

• Review of product specific handling requirements 

• Product specific safety tips 

• Product specific personal protective equipment requirements 

• Product specific calibration practice 

• Review of general spill containments and clean-up requirements 

• Review of product specific spill containment 

• Demonstration of spill container procedures 

• Detailed review of product labels 

• Detailed review of product Material Safety Data Sheets 

• Overview of product specific mode of action 

• Overview of product specific carrier and delivery systems 
 
 

iv. Technical Training: Clarke has long been the leader in providing ‘Stewardship through Education’.  Annually, 
Clarke provides over 70 educational workshops to mosquito control professionals nationwide.  Clarke Mosquito 
Control is your host for the annual ½ day training workshop. This is helpful for those on your mosquito control 
staff choosing to continue their education as well as helping them achieve their required CEU credits for their 
Public Health Pest Control Applicator licenses. Clarke Workshop is approved for a total of 5 CEUs. (4 Public Health 
and 1 Core CEU). Clarke has provided the below Workshops for Pinellas County:  
 

Pinellas County 
 Workshop Dates 

Pinellas County  
Workshop Dates 

9/17/2003 2/20/2013 

3/24/2004 3/12/2014 

3/23/2005 4/8/2015 

4/18/2006 3/15/2016 

3/12/2007 3/7/2017 

2/21/2008 4/18/2018 

3/24/2009 4/17/2019 

3/23/2010 3/11/2020 

3/10/2011 5/14/2021 (Virtual) 

3/15/2012 3/17/2022 (Virtual) 

 
 

v. Field Product Evaluation: Pinellas County will have direct access to our three (3) field biologist located in close 
proximity to provide product consultation, field trial support, resistance testing, etc. Most recently, Clarke 
provided staff and equipment for field trial conducted on May 5th, 2021. Clarke has an additional efficacy trial 
scheduled for May 31st to June 2nd, 2022. 

 
Good product efficacy begins with product and application training.  Clarke will provide written protocols for all 
field product evaluations.  Protocols will include input from the manufacturers, input from the County, as well as 
input from Clarke’s team of scientists in our Global Support and Environmental Services research and 
development department.  A detailed, onsite review by a member of our technical support team will be 
conducted prior to a product field evaluation.  This review will include, but is not limited to: 

 

• Review of protocol 

• Review of application equipment  

• Calibration of application equipment 



     
 
 

• Review of application site 

• Unique environmental conditions of the site 

• Onsite witness of application 

• Assistance of efficacy monitoring 

• Assist in and/or provide a written report documenting efficacy 
 

Clarke will provide, via the manufacturer, the original certificate of analysis documenting the potency of the 
product.  In addition, Clarke will, on an as needed basis, send a sample of the product to our Research & 
Development Diagnostic lab or an independent lab to verify product potency. 

 
vi. Product Samples: Clarke will provide at no cost adequate amounts of each product formulation to calibrate both 

aerial and ground-based equipment.  This is a service we have provided to Pinellas County in the past.  As part of 
our stewardship program, Clarke’s technical support staff working together with Pinellas County staff and the 
Manufacturer’s staff will characterize both aerial and ground equipment to meet EPA, industry and FDACS 
standards.  As requested by the County, Clarke will utilize WRK Granule Calibration System to ensure the usable 
swath and application rate are determined and are consistent.  Wellmark staff members, the manufacturer of 
Altosid, will always be welcome to participate in equipment calibration.  The equipment characterization and 
calibration process is recommended and will be available as needed twice per year or as requested by the County.  
Clarke Technical Support staff will also be simultaneously training Pinellas staff members on calibration 
techniques and providing hands on training and assistance throughout the process as requested by the County. 

 
vii. Technical/Professional Assistance: For all awarded products, Pinellas County will have direct access to our three 

(3) field biologist located in close proximity to provide product consultation, field trial support, resistance testing, 
etc. Clarke offers Pinellas County the annual on-site calibration and particle testing of equipment to meet state 
regulations.  
 
Clarke has the only research and development department that is dedicated solely to the Vector Industry.  Part of 
that department includes a mobile technical support team.  The mission of the technical support team is to 
provide professional onsite technical assistance.  This assistance includes equipment and application 
modifications.  Clarke has long been an innovator in application equipment performance.  One such modification 
greatly improved the effective swath of the Isolaire Granular application equipment that we utilize on our Bell 47 
helicopters.  This type of information has been and will continue to be shared with the Pinellas County Mosquito 
Control staff. 
 

viii. Resistance Testing: To assure proper stewardship of the products supplied by Clarke, we will provide onsite 
assistance via our Field Science technical support staff.  We also will involve the manufacturer and their scientific 
staff to assist in any resistance testing.  Clarke’s technical staff will follow a written protocol to monitor any 
suspected resistance to an active ingredient.  Clarke also will, on an as needed basis, provide via our in house 
diagnostic lab/scientist confirmation tolerance to an active ingredient.  Product application verification will be 
determined by utilizing our WRK granular calibration system to verify application rates.  Product application rates 
will be verified as part of any resistance testing protocol.  Water samples from the treated site may be taken to 
determine the amount of active ingredient present in the site. 
 

ix. Off -Site Storage: In 2021, Clarke acquired a 40,000+ SF warehouse that can provide off-site storage capacity for 
Pinellas County. Clarke has four (6) offices in the State of Florida.  The closest office to Pinellas County, Kissimmee 
has ample climate-controlled warehouse storage available should the County deem necessary to store products 
offsite.  We also have product warehouses in Arkansas and Illinois to store additional inventory.  In addition, 
Clarke has worked closely with our manufacturers to provide storage options for Pinellas County.  One such 
solution was to provide climate controlled semi-truck trailers onsite at no charge to the County.  This type of 
commitment and value-added service has allowed the County to take advantage of quantity purchase savings.  



     
 
 

Additionally, should the County need product on an urgent need basis, Clarke will facilitate a Fed Ex type delivery.  
In an emergency, Clarke may elect to supply the County from our service business inventory until the 
manufacturer can provide product (basically borrow product from our service company inventory). 

  
x. Formulation Verification: Clarke will provide a copy of the original certificate of analysis for each lot number for 

each product delivered.  This will be supplied via the manufacturer and on a per request basis.  Should there 
appear to be a potency problem, Clarke will, at no charge to the County, provide product potency testing via our 
in-house diagnostic lab or an independent laboratory. Certificate of Analysis reports will verify odor, appearance, 
density, and % of active ingredient. 
 

xi. Complimentary Equipment: In the recent past, as part of high-volume purchases by the County of Clarke 
manufactured products and or certain Clarke distributed products, Clarke has provided various mosquito control 
related equipment to the County at no charge.  In one such example, Clarke provided a new Isolaire Aerial 
Granule Spreader for your helicopter.  This piece of equipment helped the County expand their larviciding 
program and deliver a more timely and effective service to the residents of Pinellas County.  Recently, Clarke 
provided a credit/rebate that the County utilized to purchase various mosquito control equipment such as 
sprayers, backpacks, dippers, etc.  Clarke will, from time to time, offer such programs on Clarke manufactured 
products and certain Clarke distributed products.  
 
The Central Life Sciences Agency Agreement to distribute Altosid products requires that all Authorized Agents bid 
the required published pricing and that discounts via free equipment are prohibited per the distribution 
agreement. Central Life Sciences does, from time to time, offer various manufacturers rebate programs. As a 
value-added service and to help Pinellas to maximize your Central Life Sciences rebates, Clarke will track your 
purchases and provide the documentation required to submit for your rebate.    

 
xii. Annual Droplet Testing: Clarke offers Pinellas County the annual on-site calibration and particle testing of 

equipment to meet state regulations.  
 

xiii. Rebate Tracking: Central Life Sciences (manufacturer of Altosid and Duplex formulations) offers an annual rebate 
program.   Clarke will track the County’s purchases and provide documentation/receipts/invoices to maximize 
your rebate.  Referenced form is attached.  

  
We hope that you will incorporate these value-added services along with our commitment to customer service when 
deciding your supplier for Agency or equivalent products. Thank you for your consideration.  Please let us know if any 
other additional information is required. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Robert “Bobby” Santana 
Regional Sales Lead 
rsantana@clarke.com 
Mobile: (561) 420-9079 

mailto:rsantana@clarke.com
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Bid No.: 22-0466-B(DG) 

Bid Title :   Mosquito Abatement Products 
Date & Time Due: Tuesday, May 31st, 2022 

5

Description                                                                        

(B)

Manufacturer                                               

(C)

Quantity 

(E)   

UOM       

(F) 

1
1,2-Dibromo-2,2-dichloroethyl dimethyl phosphate 

Naled 87.4% (Dibrom® concentrate)
Manufacturer: AMVAC No bid 30 gallon Packaging: 30-gallon drum -$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

2
Bacillus thuringiensis subspecies israelensis Bti 

(Bactimos Briquet)

Manufacturer: Summit 

Chemical
1000 briquettes

Typical Packaging: Case of 

100 Briquettes
1.00$                        1,000.00$                             2,000.00$                                           

3
Piperonyl butoxide and permethrin (Biomist® 31+66 

ULV)

Manufacturer: Clarke 

Mosquito Control Products, 

Inc.

No bid 550 gallon
Packaging: 275-gallon 

reusable tote
-$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

4 White Mineral Oil (10% w/w) (CocoBear™)

Manufacturer: Clarke 

Mosquito Control Products, 

Inc

300 gallon Packaging:  2.5 Gallon 40.00$                      12,000.00$                           24,000.00$                                         

5 BVA2 Mosquito Larvicide Oil
Manufacturer: BV 

Associates, Inc.
Envirotech Oil 300 gallon Packaging:  2.5-gallon jug 65.93$                      19,779.00$                           39,558.00$                                         

6 Piperonyl butoxide, phenothrin, prallethrin (Duet®)

Manufacturer: Clarke 

Mosquito Control Products, 

Inc

165 gallon
Packaging: 275 gallon 

reusable tote (liquid form)
221.31$                    36,516.15$                           73,032.30$                                         

7
Spinosad (mix of spinosyn A and spinosyn D) 

(Natular™ G)

Manufacturer: Clarke 

Mosquito Control Products, 

Inc

15,000 lbs. Packaging:  40 pound bag 8.01$                        120,150.00$                         240,300.00$                                       

8
Spinosad (mix of spinosyn A and spinosyn D) 

(Natular™ G30) (Extended Release Granule)

Manufacturer: Clarke 

Mosquito Control Products, 

Inc

15,000 lbs. Packaging:  40 pound bag 18.01$                      270,150.00$                         540,300.00$                                       

9
Spinosad (mix of spinosyn A & spinosyn D) (Natular™ 

T30)

Manufacturer: Clarke 

Mosquito Control Products, 

Inc

8,000 tablets
Typical Packaging: Case of 

400 tablets 
1.99$                        15,920.00$                           31,840.00$                                         

10
Spinosad (mix of spinosyn A & spinosyn D) 

(Natular™ XRT)

Manufacturer: Clarke 

Mosquito Control Products, 

Inc

660 tablets
Typical Packaging: Case of 

220 tablets
4.89$                        3,227.40$                             6,454.80$                                           

11
Spinosad (mix of spinosyn A & spinosyn D) 

(Natular™ DT)

Manufacturer: Clarke 

Mosquito Control Products, 

Inc

15,200       tablets

Typical Packaging: Case 

4,000 tablets (16 pouches 

of 250 each)

Available packsizes: 50x50ct cards (2,500 tablets) or 50x12ct cards (600 tablets)0.55$                        8,360.00$                             16,720.00$                                         

**Any Equivalent products offered below shall meet the Criteria identified in EXHIBIT A - PRODUCT LIST  See Section E Item 3.**Please complete the EXHIBIT C - ALTERNATE PRODUCT DATA SHEET for all PROPOSED ALTERNATE PRODUCTS in 

Column (D) 

*Unit Pricing shall be inclusive of all shipping, fuel, off-loading, insurance and any other cost or fee incurred. Bidders are encouraged to pay special attention to the Container Unit Size.                                                                     For example: 600 

gallon, 15 cases, briquettes, tablets etc. 

Product Info

 Two (2) Year Total                         

(K)                                                    

(J) x (2) = (K) 

Estimated Annual (12 

month) Quantity
Product 

No.            

(A) 

Container Size                              

(G)

 Annual Total                   (J)                                      

(E)  x (I) = (J) 

**PROPOSED PRODUCT 

ALTERNATE                          

(D)

*PROPOSED  ALTERNATE  

Container Size                            

(Complete if different from 

Column (G))                                

(H)

*Unit Price Per UOM                         

(I)

Clarke Completed Advertisement Section F - Bid Submittal_1 Page 1 of 4 BID SUMMARY



Bid No.: 22-0466-B(DG) 

Bid Title :   Mosquito Abatement Products 
Date & Time Due: Tuesday, May 31st, 2022 

5

Description                                                                        

(B)

Manufacturer                                               

(C)

Quantity 

(E)   

UOM       

(F) 

**Any Equivalent products offered below shall meet the Criteria identified in EXHIBIT A - PRODUCT LIST  See Section E Item 3.**Please complete the EXHIBIT C - ALTERNATE PRODUCT DATA SHEET for all PROPOSED ALTERNATE PRODUCTS in 

Column (D) 

*Unit Pricing shall be inclusive of all shipping, fuel, off-loading, insurance and any other cost or fee incurred. Bidders are encouraged to pay special attention to the Container Unit Size.                                                                     For example: 600 

gallon, 15 cases, briquettes, tablets etc. 

Product Info

 Two (2) Year Total                         

(K)                                                    

(J) x (2) = (K) 

Estimated Annual (12 

month) Quantity
Product 

No.            

(A) 

Container Size                              

(G)

 Annual Total                   (J)                                      

(E)  x (I) = (J) 

**PROPOSED PRODUCT 

ALTERNATE                          

(D)

*PROPOSED  ALTERNATE  

Container Size                            

(Complete if different from 

Column (G))                                

(H)

*Unit Price Per UOM                         

(I)

12 S-Methoprene 4.25% (MetaLarv® S-PT)
Manufacturer: Valent 

BioSciences Corporation
Altosid P35 (S-Methoprene 4.25%) 6,000         lbs.

Packaging:  40 pound bag 

(30 bags/pallet)
18.72$                      112,320.00$                         224,640.00$                                       

13
Bacillus thuringiensis subsp israelensis strain AM 65-

52 (VectoBac® GS)

Manufacturer: Valent 

BioSciences Corp.
No bid 25,000       lbs. Packaging: 40 pound bag -$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

14
Bacillus thuringiensis subspecies israelensis strain 

AM65-52 (VectoBac® 12AS)

Manufacturer: Valent 

BioSciences Corp.
No bid 10 gallon

Packaging: 2.5 gallon (10 

liter) HDPE plastic jugs, 

packaged 2 per case

-$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

15
Bacillus thuringiensis subsp israelensis strain AM 65-

52 (VectoBac® WDG)

Manufacturer: Valent 

BioSciences Corp.
No bid 24 lbs.

Packaging: case of 24 

single pound containers
-$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

16
Bacillus thuringiensis subspecies israelensis strain AM 

65-52 (VectoBac® WDG)

Manufacturer: Valent 

BioSciences Corp.
No bid 500 lbs. Packaging: 25 lbs. drum -$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

17
Bacillus sphaericus Serotype H5a5b strain 2362 

(VectoLex® FG)

Manufacturer: Valent 

BioSciences Corporation
No bid 45,600 lbs.

Packaging: 40 pound bag 

(granular) (30 bags per 

pallet)

-$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

18
Bacillus sphaericus 2362 (strain ABTS-1743) 

(VectoLex® WDG)

Manufacturer: Valent 

BioSciences Corporation
No bid 500 lbs. Packaging: 25 pound drum -$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

19
Bacillus sphaericus 2362, serotype H5a5b, strain 

ABTS 1743 (VectoLex® WSP)

Manufacturer: Valent 

BioSciences Corporation
No bid 2,400

10 gram 

packets

Typical Packaging: Case of 

800 (10 gram packets) 

(granular water soluble 

packet)

-$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

20

Bacillus sphaericus 2362 , Serotype H5a5b, strain 

ABTS 1743 2.7%; Bacillus thuringiensis  Subsp. 

israelensis Serotype H-14 Strain AM65-52 4.5% 

(VectoMax® FG)

Manufacturer: Valent 

BioSciences Corporation
No bid 30,000 lbs.

Packaging:  40 pound bags 

(fine granule) 

(30 bags/pallet)

-$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

21 Etofenprox 4% (Zenivex E4 RTU)
Manufacturer: Wellmark 

International
5 gallon

Packaging:  2.5 gallon jug x 

2
92.52$                      462.60$                                925.20$                                              

22
Bacillus thuringiensis  subsp. Israelensis,  strain AM 65-

52 6.07%, methoprene10% (VectoPrime® FG)

Manufacturer: Valent 

BioSciences Corporation
No bid 30,000 lbs.

Packaging:  40 pound bags 

(fine granule) 

(30 bags/pallet)

-$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

Clarke Completed Advertisement Section F - Bid Submittal_1 Page 2 of 4 BID SUMMARY



Bid No.: 22-0466-B(DG) 

Bid Title :   Mosquito Abatement Products 
Date & Time Due: Tuesday, May 31st, 2022 

5

Description                                                                        

(B)

Manufacturer                                               

(C)

Quantity 

(E)   

UOM       

(F) 

**Any Equivalent products offered below shall meet the Criteria identified in EXHIBIT A - PRODUCT LIST  See Section E Item 3.**Please complete the EXHIBIT C - ALTERNATE PRODUCT DATA SHEET for all PROPOSED ALTERNATE PRODUCTS in 

Column (D) 

*Unit Pricing shall be inclusive of all shipping, fuel, off-loading, insurance and any other cost or fee incurred. Bidders are encouraged to pay special attention to the Container Unit Size.                                                                     For example: 600 

gallon, 15 cases, briquettes, tablets etc. 

Product Info

 Two (2) Year Total                         

(K)                                                    

(J) x (2) = (K) 

Estimated Annual (12 

month) Quantity
Product 

No.            

(A) 

Container Size                              

(G)

 Annual Total                   (J)                                      

(E)  x (I) = (J) 

**PROPOSED PRODUCT 

ALTERNATE                          

(D)

*PROPOSED  ALTERNATE  

Container Size                            

(Complete if different from 

Column (G))                                

(H)

*Unit Price Per UOM                         

(I)

23 Permanone 31-66 Manufacturer: Bayer 

Environmental Science
No bid 550 gallon Packaging:  275 gallon tote -$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

24 Fyfanon ULV
Manufacturer: Cheminova, 

Inc. 
No bid 275 gallon Packaging:  275 gallon tote -$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

25 MERUS® 3.0

Manufacturer: Clarke 

Mosquito Control Products, 

Inc.

275 gallon Packaging:  275 gallon tote 317.37$                    87,276.75$                           174,553.50$                                       

26 BVA 13
Manufacturer: BV 

Associates, Inc.
No bid 10 gallon 5 gallon jug -$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

27 Deltamethrin 2.0%, a Type II pyrethroid. (DeltaGard®)
Manufacturer: Bayer 

Environmental Science
No bid 270 gallon

Packaging:  30 gallon 

returnable container
-$                          -$                                      -$                                                    

28 Methoprene 2.1% (Altosid® XR Briquettes)
Manufacturer: Wellmark 

International
660 briquettes

Typical Packaging: Case of 

220 Briquettes
3.58$                        2,362.80$                             4,725.60$                                           

29 Methoprene 8.62% (Altosid® 30-Day Briquettes)
Manufacturer: Wellmark 

International
4,800 briquettes

Typical Packaging: Case of 

400 Briquettes
1.25$                        6,000.00$                             12,000.00$                                         

30 Methoprene 1.5% (Altosid® XR-G)
Manufacturer: Wellmark 

International
6,000 lbs. Packaging: 40 pound bags 9.40$                        56,400.00$                           112,800.00$                                       

31
Methoprene 4.25% (Zoecon® Altosid® P35 (Altosid® 

P35))

Manufacturer: Wellmark 

International
4,800 lbs.

Packaging: 30 bags of 40 

lbs. each (1,200 lbs. 

Palletized)

18.72$                      89,856.00$                           179,712.00$                                       

32 Methoprene .2% (Altosid® SBG II)
Manufacturer: Wellmark 

International
48,000 lbs.

Packaging: 40 pound bags 

(30 bags/pallet)
3.38$                        162,240.00$                         324,480.00$                                       

2,008,041.40$                           Two (2) Year Total

Clarke Completed Advertisement Section F - Bid Submittal_1 Page 3 of 4 BID SUMMARY



Bid No.: 22-0466-B(DG) 

Bid Title :   Mosquito Abatement Products 
Date & Time Due: Tuesday, May 31st, 2022 

5

Description                                                                        

(B)

Manufacturer                                               

(C)

Quantity 

(E)   

UOM       

(F) 
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Column (D) 

*Unit Pricing shall be inclusive of all shipping, fuel, off-loading, insurance and any other cost or fee incurred. Bidders are encouraged to pay special attention to the Container Unit Size.                                                                     For example: 600 

gallon, 15 cases, briquettes, tablets etc. 

Product Info

 Two (2) Year Total                         

(K)                                                    

(J) x (2) = (K) 

Estimated Annual (12 

month) Quantity
Product 

No.            

(A) 

Container Size                              

(G)

 Annual Total                   (J)                                      

(E)  x (I) = (J) 

**PROPOSED PRODUCT 

ALTERNATE                          

(D)

*PROPOSED  ALTERNATE  

Container Size                            

(Complete if different from 

Column (G))                                

(H)

*Unit Price Per UOM                         

(I)

Item Manufacturer MSRP Price Website Discount %

1

2

3

Item Product Order Size Pricing

1

2

3

BULK ORDER PRICING - List any other bulk order sizes and pricing that can be offered at a savings.  THIS ITEM WILL NOT BE USED TO 

DETERMINE AWARD.

MANUFACTURER DISCOUNTS - List Manufacturer Name, MSRP published price website and % discount offered for other related mosquito abatement 

products. THIS ITEM WILL NOT BE USED TO DETERMINE AWARD.
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