
 PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA

Section F - Bid Summary

Bid No.:   21-0622-B-BW

Bid Title :   Ground Storage Tanks Inspection, Cleaning & Disinfecting - SCBWRF

Date & Time Due:  September 23, 2021  at  3:00PM EST

AWARDED AREAS HIGHLIGHTED IN GREEN

Line Location  - 3655 Keller Circle Tarpon Springs, FL 34688 (7.5 Million Gallon Tank) Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price

1 Inspection & Reporting Cost (As per page 18, Section C- 1.) – Tank Drained 5,100.00$                           1 5,100.00$                                       2,490.00$                           1 2,490.00$                                       3,500.00$                           1 3,500.00$                                        $                          7,000.00 1 7,000.00$                                       

2 Cleaning cost with 1" or less of sedimentation – Tank Drained  11,000.00$                         1 11,000.00$                                     7,990.00$                           1 7,990.00$                                       26,370.00$                         1 26,370.00$                                      $                          6,000.00 1 6,000.00$                                       

3 Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation – Tank Drained  9,000.00$                           1 9,000.00$                                       2,690.00$                           1 2,690.00$                                       9,360.00$                           1 9,360.00$                                        $                          6,000.00 1 6,000.00$                                       

4 Cleaning 450.00$                              1 450.00$                                          13,450.00$                         1 13,450.00$                                     24,550.00$                         1 24,550.00$                                      $                        18,000.00 1 18,000.00$                                     

5 Disinfecting 450.00$                              1 450.00$                                          900.00$                              1 900.00$                                          6,400.00$                           1 6,400.00$                                        $                          9,000.00 1 9,000.00$                                       

6  Must meet requirements of FAC 62-555.350  and in Accordance of AWWA C652-11

130,000.00$                                 137,600.00$                                 350,900.00$                                 230,000.00$                                 

Line
Location  - 27707 US 19 North; Clearwater, FL 33761 (5.0 Million Gallon Tank) (There are four tanks located at this 

address)
Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price

6 Inspection & Reporting Cost (As per page 18, Section C- 1.) – Tank Drained  $                          4,100.00 4 16,400.00$                                      $                          2,490.00 4 9,960.00$                                        $                          3,500.00 4 14,000.00$                                      $                          7,000.00 4 28,000.00$                                     

7 Cleaning cost with 1" or less of sedimentation – Tank Drained   $                          7,980.00 4 31,920.00$                                      $                          7,990.00 4 31,960.00$                                      $                        21,500.00 4 86,000.00$                                      $                          4,000.00 4 16,000.00$                                     

8 Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation – Tank Drained   $                          7,500.00 4 30,000.00$                                      $                          2,690.00 4 10,760.00$                                      $                          7,233.00 4 28,932.00$                                      $                          4,000.00 4 16,000.00$                                     

9 Cleaning  $                             300.00 4 1,200.00$                                        $                        10,760.00 4 43,040.00$                                      $                        17,900.00 4 71,600.00$                                      $                        14,000.00 4 56,000.00$                                     

10 Disinfecting  $                             300.00 4 1,200.00$                                        $                             900.00 4 3,600.00$                                        $                          6,400.00 4 25,600.00$                                      $                          7,000.00 4 28,000.00$                                     

11  Must meet requirements of FAC 62-555.350  and in Accordance of AWWA C652-11

403,600.00$                                 496,600.00$                                 1,130,660.00$                             720,000.00$                                 

Location  - 1620 Ridge Road, Largo, FL 33778 (5.0 Million Gallon Tank) (There are two tanks located at this address) Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price

11 Inspection & Reporting Cost (As per page 18, Section C- 1.) – Tank Drained  $                          4,100.00 2 8,200.00$                                        $                          2,490.00 2 4,980.00$                                        $                          3,500.00 2 7,000.00$                                        $                          7,000.00 2 14,000.00$                                     

12 Cleaning cost with 1" or less of sedimentation – Tank Drained   $                          7,980.00 2 15,960.00$                                      $                          7,990.00 2 15,980.00$                                      $                        21,500.00 2 43,000.00$                                      $                          5,000.00 2 10,000.00$                                     

13 Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation – Tank Drained   $                          7,500.00 2 15,000.00$                                      $                          2,690.00 2 5,380.00$                                        $                          7,233.00 2 14,466.00$                                      $                          5,000.00 2 10,000.00$                                     

14 Cleaning  $                             300.00 2 600.00$                                           $                        10,760.00 2 21,520.00$                                      $                        17,900.00 2 35,800.00$                                      $                        15,000.00 2 30,000.00$                                     

15 Disinfecting  $                             300.00 2 600.00$                                           $                             900.00 2 1,800.00$                                        $                          6,400.00 2 12,800.00$                                      $                          7,000.00 2 14,000.00$                                     

16  Must meet requirements of FAC 62-555.350  and in Accordance of AWWA C652-11

201,800.00$                                 248,300.00$                                 565,330.00$                                 390,000.00$                                 

Line Location  - 12050 2nd Street East, Treasure Island, FL 33706 (5.0 Million Tank) Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price

16 Inspection & Reporting Cost (As per page 18, Section C- 1.) – Tank Drained  $                          4,100.00 1 4,100.00$                                       2,490.00$                           1 2,490.00$                                        $                          3,500.00 1 3,500.00$                                        $                          7,000.00 1 7,000.00$                                       

17 Cleaning cost with 1" or less of sedimentation – Tank Drained   $                          7,980.00 1 7,980.00$                                       7,990.00$                           1 7,990.00$                                        $                        21,500.00 1 21,500.00$                                      $                          5,000.00 1 5,000.00$                                       

18 Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation – Tank Drained   $                          7,500.00 1 7,500.00$                                       2,690.00$                           1 2,690.00$                                        $                          7,233.00 1 7,233.00$                                        $                          5,000.00 1 5,000.00$                                       

19 Cleaning  $                             300.00 1 300.00$                                          10,760.00$                         1 10,760.00$                                      $                        17,900.00 1 17,900.00$                                      $                        18,000.00 1 18,000.00$                                     

20 Disinfecting  $                             300.00 1 300.00$                                          900.00$                              1 900.00$                                           $                          6,400.00 1 6,400.00$                                        $                          7,000.00 1 7,000.00$                                       

21  Must meet requirements of FAC 62-555.350  and in Accordance of AWWA C652-11

100,900.00$                                 124,150.00$                                 282,665.00$                                 210,000.00$                                 

Line Location  - 4501 Gulf Blvd., St Pete Beach, FL 33706 (2.0 Million Gallon Tank) Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price

21 Inspection & Reporting Cost (As per page 18, Section C- 1.) – Tank Drained  $                          3,210.00 1 3,210.00$                                       2,490.00$                           1 2,490.00$                                        $                          3,500.00 1 3,500.00$                                        $                          7,000.00 1 7,000.00$                                       

22 Cleaning cost with 1" or less of sedimentation – Tank Drained   $                          4,750.00 1 4,750.00$                                       5,380.00$                           1 5,380.00$                                        $                        14,400.00 1 14,400.00$                                      $                          4,000.00 1 4,000.00$                                       

23 Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation – Tank Drained   $                          3,500.00 1 3,500.00$                                       2,690.00$                           1 2,690.00$                                        $                          5,200.00 1 5,200.00$                                        $                          4,000.00 1 4,000.00$                                       

24 Cleaning  $                             150.00 1 150.00$                                          7,990.00$                           1 7,990.00$                                        $                        14,400.00 1 14,400.00$                                      $                        11,000.00 1 11,000.00$                                     

25 Disinfecting  $                             150.00 1 150.00$                                          900.00$                              1 900.00$                                           $                          6,400.00 1 6,400.00$                                        $                          5,000.00 1 5,000.00$                                       

26  Must meet requirements of FAC 62-555.350  and in Accordance of AWWA C652-11

58,800.00$                                   97,250.00$                                   219,500.00$                                 155,000.00$                                 

Line Location - 7401 54th Ave N, St. Petersburg, FL   (6.5 Million Gallon  EQ Tank) Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price

26
Inspection & Reporting Cost (As per page 18, Section C- 1.) – Tank Drained

 $                          4,850.00 
1

4,850.00$                                       2,490.00$                           
1

2,490.00$                                        $                          3,500.00 
1

3,500.00$                                        $                          7,000.00 
1

7,000.00$                                       

27
Cleaning cost with 1" or less of sedimentation – Tank Drained  

 $                          9,500.00 
1

9,500.00$                                       7,990.00$                           
1

7,990.00$                                        $                        24,070.00 
1

24,070.00$                                      $                          8,000.00 
1

8,000.00$                                       

28
Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation – Tank Drained  

 $                          8,750.00 
1

8,750.00$                                       2,690.00$                           
1

2,690.00$                                        $                          9,360.00 
1

9,360.00$                                        $                          8,000.00 
1

8,000.00$                                       

29
Cleaning

 $                             400.00 
1

400.00$                                          12,105.00$                         
1

12,105.00$                                      $                        22,500.00 
1

22,500.00$                                      $                        18,000.00 
1

18,000.00$                                     

30
Disinfecting

 $                             400.00 
1

400.00$                                          900.00$                              
1

900.00$                                           $                          6,400.00 
1

6,400.00$                                        $                          8,000.00 
1

8,000.00$                                       

31
 Must meet requirements of FAC 62-555.350  and in Accordance of AWWA C652-11

119,500.00$                                 130,875.00$                                 329,150.00$                                 245,000.00$                                 

Line Location -McKay,  11700 Hamlin Blvd, Largo, FL (5 Million Gallon Tank) Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price

Underwater Solutions Inc Crom LLC Razorback LLCPetrotech Southeast Inc DBA Tank Engineering

GROUP 1 - Above Ground Tank Inspecitons

Total 

Total 

Total 

Total 

Total 

Total 



31
Inspection & Reporting Cost (As per page 18, Section C- 1.) – Tank Drained

 $                          4,100.00 
1

4,100.00$                                       2,490.00$                           
1

2,490.00$                                        $                          3,500.00 
1

3,500.00$                                        $                          7,000.00 
1

7,000.00$                                       

32
Cleaning cost with 1" or less of sedimentation – Tank Drained  

 $                          7,980.00 
1

7,980.00$                                       7,990.00$                           
1

7,990.00$                                        $                        21,500.00 
1

21,500.00$                                      $                          5,000.00 
1

5,000.00$                                       

33
Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation – Tank Drained  

 $                          7,500.00 
1

7,500.00$                                       2,690.00$                           
1

2,690.00$                                        $                          7,233.00 
1

7,233.00$                                        $                          5,000.00 
1

5,000.00$                                       

34
Cleaning

 $                             300.00 
1

300.00$                                          10,760.00$                         
1

10,760.00$                                      $                        17,900.00 
1

17,900.00$                                      $                        15,000.00 
1

15,000.00$                                     

35
Disinfecting

 $                             300.00 
1

300.00$                                          900.00$                              
1

900.00$                                           $                          6,400.00 
1

6,400.00$                                        $                          7,000.00 
1

7,000.00$                                       

36
 Must meet requirements of FAC 62-555.350  and in Accordance of AWWA C652-11

100,900.00$                                 124,150.00$                                 282,665.00$                                 195,000.00$                                 

Line Location - 7401 54th Ave N, St. Petersburg, FL   (6 Million Gallon Tank) there are 3 tanks at this location Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price

36
Inspection & Reporting Cost (As per page 18, Section C- 1.) – Tank Drained

 $                          4,600.00 
3

13,800.00$                                      $                          2,490.00 
3

7,470.00$                                        $                          3,500.00 
3

10,500.00$                                      $                          7,000.00 
3

21,000.00$                                     

37
Cleaning cost with 1" or less of sedimentation – Tank Drained  

 $                          8,750.00 
3

26,250.00$                                      $                          7,990.00 
3

23,970.00$                                      $                        21,990.00 
3

65,970.00$                                      $                          8,000.00 
3

24,000.00$                                     

38
Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation – Tank Drained  

 $                          8,500.00 
3

25,500.00$                                      $                          2,690.00 
3

8,070.00$                                        $                          8,030.00 
3

24,090.00$                                      $                          8,000.00 
3

24,000.00$                                     

39
Cleaning

 $                             400.00 
3

1,200.00$                                        $                        12,105.00 
3

36,315.00$                                      $                        21,200.00 
3

63,600.00$                                      $                        18,000.00 
3

54,000.00$                                     

40
Disinfecting

 $                             400.00 
3

1,200.00$                                        $                             900.00 
3

2,700.00$                                        $                          6,400.00 
3

19,200.00$                                      $                          8,000.00 
3

24,000.00$                                     

41
 Must meet requirements of FAC 62-555.350  and in Accordance of AWWA C652-11

339,750.00$                                 392,625.00$                                 916,800.00$                                 735,000.00$                                 

Line Location - 3120 Tampa Road, Oldsmar, FL (5 Million Gallon Tank) Dunn Intertie Tank Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price Price Per Tank Number of Tanks Extended Price

41
Inspection & Reporting Cost (As per page 18, Section C- 1.) – Tank Drained

 $                          4,100.00 
1

4,100.00$                                        $                          2,490.00 
1

2,490.00$                                        $                          3,500.00 
1

3,500.00$                                        $                          7,000.00 
1

7,000.00$                                       

42
Cleaning cost with 1" or less of sedimentation – Tank Drained  

 $                          7,980.00 
1

7,980.00$                                        $                          7,990.00 
1

7,990.00$                                        $                        21,500.00 
1

21,500.00$                                      $                          6,000.00 
1

6,000.00$                                       

43
Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation – Tank Drained  

 $                          7,500.00 
1

7,500.00$                                        $                          2,690.00 
1

2,690.00$                                        $                          7,233.00 
1

7,233.00$                                        $                          6,000.00 
1

6,000.00$                                       

44
Cleaning

 $                             300.00 
1

300.00$                                           $                        10,760.00 
1

10,760.00$                                      $                        17,900.00 
1

17,900.00$                                      $                        15,000.00 
1

15,000.00$                                     

45
Disinfecting

 $                             300.00 
1

300.00$                                           $                             900.00 
1

900.00$                                           $                          6,400.00 
1

6,400.00$                                        $                          7,000.00 
1

7,000.00$                                       

46
 Must meet requirements of FAC 62-555.350  and in Accordance of AWWA C652-11

100,900.00$                                 124,150.00$                                 282,665.00$                                 205,000.00$                                 

Group 1 Total 1,556,150.00$                    Group 1 Total 1,875,700.00$                    Group 1 Total 4,360,335.00$                    Group 1 Total 3,085,000.00$                    

Line Location - 3120 Tampa Road, Oldsmar, FL (5 Million Gallon Tank) Dunn Intertie Tank UOM Estimated Quantity Rate Extended Price UOM Estimated Quantity Rate Extended Price UOM Estimated Quantity Rate Extended Price UOM Estimated Quantity Rate Extended Price

1

Structural (compromising the integrity of structure) concrete crack repair per Linear Foot (L.F.)(Including all Labor, 

supervision, equipment and travel)  Per Linear Foot 100 NO BID #VALUE! Per Linear Foot 100 -$                                                -$                                                Per Linear Foot 100 95.50$                                            9,550.00$                                       Per Linear Foot 100 168.00$                                          16,800.00$                                     

2

Leaking concrete crack repair (actively leaking water) per Linear Foot (L.F.) (Including all Labor, supervision, 

equipment and travel)   Per Linear Foot 100 NO BID #VALUE! Per Linear Foot 100 130.00$                                          13,000.00$                                     Per Linear Foot 100 105.50$                                          10,550.00$                                     Per Linear Foot 100 280.00$                                          28,000.00$                                     

3 Surface concrete crack repair per Linear Foot (L.F.) (Including all Labor, supervision, equipment and travel)  Per Linear Foot 100 NO BID #VALUE! Per Linear Foot 100 95.00$                                            9,500.00$                                       Per Linear Foot 100 45.00$                                            4,500.00$                                       Per Linear Foot 100 48.00$                                            4,800.00$                                       

4 Hollow repair per square foot (Including all Labor, supervision, equipment and travel)   Per Linear Foot 100 NO BID #VALUE! Per Linear Foot 100 -$                                                -$                                                Per Linear Foot 100 158.75$                                          15,875.00$                                     Per Linear Foot 100 205.00$                                          20,500.00$                                     

5

Floor and wall seal replacement for 7.5 million tank - (Including seal with floor and walls, Labor, supervision, 

equipment and travel)  Per Tank 4 NO BID #VALUE! Per Tank 4 -$                                                -$                                                Per Tank 4 7,181.25$                                       28,725.00$                                     Per Tank 4 28,000.00$                                     112,000.00$                                   

6 Manhole seal replacement (Furnish and install all new manhole cover seals) for 7.5 million Tank Per Tank 4 NO BID #VALUE! Per Tank 4 -$                                                -$                                                Per Tank 4 375.00$                                          1,500.00$                                       Per Tank 4 2,200.00$                                       8,800.00$                                       

7

Replacement seal for dome access hatch (Furnish and install all new Neoprene insect barrier seals) for 7.5 million 

Tank Per Tank 4 NO BID #VALUE! Per Tank 4 -$                                                -$                                                Per Tank 4 287.50$                                          1,150.00$                                       Per Tank 4 736.00$                                          2,944.00$                                       

8

Floor and wall seal replacement for 5.0 million tank - (Including seal with floor and walls, Labor, supervision, 

equipment and travel)  Per Tank 4 NO BID #VALUE! Per Tank 4 -$                                                -$                                                Per Tank 4 6,565.00$                                       26,260.00$                                     Per Tank 4 24,000.00$                                     96,000.00$                                     

9 Manhole seal replacement (Furnish and install all new manhole cover seals) for 5.0 million Tank Per Tank 4 NO BID #VALUE! Per Tank 4 -$                                                -$                                                Per Tank 4 325.00$                                          1,300.00$                                       Per Tank 4 2,200.00$                                       8,800.00$                                       

10

Replacement seal for dome access hatch (Furnish and install all new Neoprene insect barrier seals) for 5.0 million 

Tank Per Tank 4 NO BID #VALUE! Per Tank 4 -$                                                -$                                                Per Tank 4 193.75$                                          775.00$                                          Per Tank 4 736.00$                                          2,944.00$                                       

11

Floor and wall seal replacement for 2.0 million tank - (Including seal with floor and walls, Labor, supervision, 

equipment and travel)  Per Tank 4 NO BID #VALUE! Per Tank 4 -$                                                -$                                                Per Tank 4 4,513.75$                                       18,055.00$                                     Per Tank 4 22,000.00$                                     88,000.00$                                     

12 Manhole seal replacement (Furnish and install all new manhole cover seals) for 2.0 million Tank Per Tank 4 NO BID #VALUE! Per Tank 4 -$                                                -$                                                Per Tank 4 325.00$                                          1,300.00$                                       Per Tank 4 2,000.00$                                       8,000.00$                                       

13

Replacement seal for dome access hatch (Furnish and install all new Neoprene insect barrier seals) for 2.0 million 

Tank Per Tank 4 NO BID #VALUE! Per Tank 4 -$                                                -$                                                Per Tank 4 193.75$                                          775.00$                                          Per Tank 4 736.00$                                          2,944.00$                                       

14 Concrete repair (Chipping and Patching) i.e. Spalled areas or areas with underlying corrosion per Cubic  foot Per Cubic Foot 100 NO BID #VALUE! Per Cubic Foot 100 420.00$                                          42,000.00$                                     Per Cubic Foot 100 649.00$                                          64,900.00$                                     Per Cubic Foot 100 487.50$                                          48,750.00$                                     

#VALUE! 322,500.00$                       926,075.00$                       2,246,410.00$                    

_ Unspecified Repairs: Total Contract Expenditure Not-To-Exceed - $100,000.00  $                               300.00  $                               950.00  $                               375.00  $                               145.00 

Bid Award Total 2,582,225.00$            5,386,410.00$                                                        Lump Sum Total2,298,200.00$                                                        5,431,410.00$                                                        

Bid Summary Bid Summary

4,360,335.00$                                                                                       Total - Group 1 3,085,000.00$                                                                                       

926,075.00$                                                                                          Total - Group 2 2,246,410.00$                                                                                       322,500.00$                                                                                          

100,000.00$                                                                                          

Bid Summary

100,000.00$                                                                                          

NO BID

100,000.00$                                                                                          

Hourly Rate

Group 2 Total Group 2 TotalGroup 2 Total

Total - Unspecified Repairs 100,000.00$                                                                                          

Group 2 Total

Hourly Rate Hourly Rate

1,656,150.00$                                                        

Bid Summary

1,875,700.00$                                                                                       

Lump Sum Total

Total - Group 1

Total - Group 2

Total - Unspecified Repairs

Lump Sum Total

Total - Group 1

Total - Group 2

Total - Unspecified Repairs

Total - Group 2

Total - Unspecified Repairs

Lump Sum Total

GROUP 2 - Tank Repair costs (All repairs are to be performed to Florida DEP rules pertaining to Public Water 

System Ground Storage Tanks

Total 

Total - Group 1

Total 

Total 

Hourly Rate

1,556,150.00$                                                                                       


