PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA

145-0387-B(PF)

CALULATIONS COMPLETED USING OPIS PRICING

FUEL: GASOLINE AND DIESEL (COOP)

Daily Average price on September 15, 2015

Gasoline: $ 1.3490
Diesel - On Road: $ 1.5229
Diesel - Off Road: $ 1.5270

ITEM 1 - TANKWAGON / Gasoline, Regular Unleaded Minimum 87 Octane

VENDOR

PRICE PER GALLON

PORT CONSOLIDATED, INC. $ 1.4220
TAC ENERGY $ 1.4661
INDIGO ENERGY PARTNERS, LLC $ 1.5140
MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY OF GAINESVILLE, INC. $ 1.5266
J.H. WILLIAMS OIL CO. $ 1.5290
JAMES RIVER SOLUTIONS NO BID
PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION NO BID
RKA PETROLEUM COMPANY NO BID

ITEM 1 - TRANSPORT / Gasoline, Regular Unleaded Minimum 87 Octane

VENDOR

PRICE PER GALLON

INDIGO ENERGY PARTNERS, LLC

1.3270

PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION

1.3289

J.H. WILLIAMS OIL CO.

1.3290

RKA PETROLEUM COMPANY

1.3309

MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY OF GAINESVILLE, INC.

1.3320

TAC ENERGY

1.3396

PORT CONSOLIDATED, INC.
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1.3740

JAMES RIVER SOLUTIONS

NO BID

ITEM 2 - TANKWAGON / Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel, Grade 2-D, S15, On Road Use

VENDOR PRICE PER GALLON
PORT CONSOLIDATED, INC. $ 1.5959
TAC ENERGY $ 1.6353
INDIGO ENERGY PARTNERS, LLC $ 1.6879
MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY OF GAINESVILLE, INC. $ 1.7005




J..H. WILLIAMS OIL CO. $ 1.7029
JAMES RIVER SOLUTIONS NO BID
PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION NO BID
RKA PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION NO BID

ITEM 2 - TRANSPORT / Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel, Grade 2-D, S15, On Road Use

VENDOR PRICE PER GALLON
INDIGO ENERGY PARTNERS, LLC $ 1.4852
MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY OF GAINESVILLE, INC. $ 1.5036
TAC ENERGY $ 1.5132
JAMES RIVER SOLUTION $ 1.5164
PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION $ 1.5184
RKA PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION $ 1.5185
J.H. WILLIAMS OIL CO. $ 1.5228
PORT CONSOLIDATED, INC. $ 1.5319

ITEM 3 - TANKWAGON / Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel, Red Dye, Grade 2-D, Off-Road

VENDOR PRICE PER GALLON
PORT CONSOLIDATED, INC. $ 1.6000
TAC ENERGY $ 1.6379
INDIGO ENERGY PARTNERS, LLC $ 1.6920
MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY OF GAINESVILLE, INC. $ 1.7046
J.H. WILLIAMS OIL CO. $ 1.7070

JAMES RIVER SOLUTIONS NO BID
PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION NO BID
RKA PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION NO BID

ITEM 3 - TRANSPORT / Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel, Red Dye, Grade 2-D, Off-Road

VENDOR PRICE PER GALLON
INDIGO ENERGY PARTNERS, LLC $ 1.4893
MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY OF GAINESVILLE, INC. $ 1.5085
TAC ENERGY $ 1.5158
PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION $ 1.5225
RKA PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION $ 1.5241
J.H. WILLIAMS OIL CO. $ 1.5269
PORT CONSOLIDATED, INC. $ 1.5420

JAMES RIVER SOLUTIONS

NO BID

PRIMARY OR ONLY VENDOR
SECONDARY VENDOR



	RANK

