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Cothron, Tyler

From: Rice, Joan
Sent: Friday, October 21, 2022 9:26 AM
To: Fechter, David D; Cothron, Tyler
Subject: FW: Grants - Intent to Apply Form Submitted to OMB - Multimodal Transportation Priority...

Here it is. 
 

Joan M. Rice, PE 
Multi-Modal Safety 
Pinellas County Transportation Planning 
22211 US 19 N, Bldg 1 
Clearwater, FL  33765 
727-464-8610 
jrice@pinellascounty.org 
 

From: Brown, Andrew W <awbrown@co.pinellas.fl.us>  
Sent: Wednesday, October 5, 2022 3:13 PM 
To: Venables, Ann <avenables@co.pinellas.fl.us>; Rice, Joan <jrice@co.pinellas.fl.us> 
Cc: Hammer Levy, Kelli <klevy@co.pinellas.fl.us>; OMB Grants Team <grants@co.pinellas.fl.us> 
Subject: FW: Grants ‐ Intent to Apply Form Submitted to OMB ‐ Multimodal Transportation Priority... 
 
Hello, 
  
OMB has no objection to the Department of Public Works submitting a grant application to the Forward Pinellas for the 
Multimodal Transportation Priority Projects. This intent to apply is for Project 003862A Belleair Rd Roadway 
Improvements from US Hwy 19 to Keene Rd. 
 
This is a multi‐year reimbursement grant project that will likely impact FY28. The requested funding is $3,550,000.00 
with $10,650,000.00 expected match. The total construction estimate is $14,200,000.00. 
  
Based on the thresholds for delegated approval, this grant application will require Board approval to apply. Please route 
the grant application through Legistar / Granicus (based on the Grants COE Granicus Approval Flowchart) to receive 
Board approval. Please include this email when you send the application through Legistar / Granicus.  
 
Once the application approval is complete, apply for the grant. Good Luck!  
 
In the event you receive the award, please follow these instructions to execute the grant agreement. If you have any 
questions, do not hesitate to contact me. Thank you! 
 
For additional instructions for grant approval and set‐up, please visit the Grants Center of Excellence Reference Page.  
 
 
Andrew Brown CPM, CAPM 
Budget & Financial Management Analyst 
Pinellas County Office of Management and Budget 
400 South Fort Harrison, 3rd Floor, Clearwater, Florida 33756 
Phone (727) 453-3390 
awbrown@pinellascounty.org 
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Follow Pinellas County:  

 
www.pinellascounty.org 
Subscribe to county updates and news 
 
Your opinion matters to us!  Please take a moment to answer a brief survey about our service: 
www.pinellascounty.org/surveys/OMB 
 
All government correspondence is subject to the public records law. 
 
 

From: Grants <no‐reply@sharepointonline.com>  
Sent: Monday, October 3, 2022 5:00 PM 
To: Brown, Andrew W <awbrown@co.pinellas.fl.us> 
Subject: Grants ‐ Intent to Apply Form Submitted to OMB ‐ Multimodal Transportation Priority... 
 
  

   Multimodal Transportation Priority... has been added       

 

Rice, Joan 
10/3/2022 4:59 PM 

Program Manager: Venables, Ann  
 

Program Manager Phone #: 727 464 8610  
 

County Department: Public Works - Transportation  
 

Director's Name: Hammer Levy, Kelli  
 

Application Submitter: Rice, Joan  
 

OMB Analyst (CIP or Operating): Brown, Andrew W  
 

Granting Agency: Foward Pinellas  
 

CFDA/CSFA #:   
 

Grant Funding Program Name: Multimodal Transportation Priority Projects  
 

Grant Funding Type: Project  
 

Grant Award Type: Reimbursement  
 

Grant Funding Program Funding Cap ($): $0.00  
 

Amount Requested: $3,550,000.00  
 

Does this Grant Cover Administrative or Management Costs?: No  
 

Amount Requested to Cover Administrative or Management Costs: $0.00  
 

What fiscal year(s) will the award amount be made available?: FY28  
 

Match Amount: $10,650,000.00  
 

Required Match Type: Cash  
 

Anticipated Match Source (Fund/Center/Program): 003862A  
 

Is the Match in the Current Budget?: Yes  
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Will the Match need to be added to the Budget?: No  
 

Total Cost of Project (including Grant, County match, and other Resources): $14,200,000.00  
 

Granting Agency Contact Name: Chelsea Favero  
 

Granting Agency Phone or Email: cfavaro@pinellascounty.org  
 

Granting Agency Address: 310 Court Street 

Clearwater, FL  33756 

  
 

OPUS Project Title: Belleair Rd Roadway Improvments from US Hwy 19 to Keene Rd  
 

Duration: Multi Year  
 

Proposed 
Abstract 
(Project Scope 
of Work): 

The purpose of the project is to design a shared-use path within the 
project limits that closes a shared use path gap from the Duke Energy 
Trailhead located west of US 19 to Eagle Lake Park, located along 
Keene Road.  The purpose of the project also includes evaluation and 
design of appropriate multimodal safety features, including pedestrian 
refuge medians, crosswalks, a stabilized shoulder, and left or right turn 
lanes (where needed) within the project limits.  Old growth oaks 
currently line Belleair Road between Havana Drive and the Pinellas 
Trail.  The proposed improvements need to avoid widening the asphalt 
in this area to avoid impacts to the existing old growth trees.  

  
 

Benefit Summary (How 
will this benefit the 
County, Dept, etc?): 

This project will benefit non motorized persons by filling in the shared use 
path gaps and adding midblock crosswalks; and will benefit motorized 
persons by reducing crash possiblilties with stablized shoulders and turn 
lanes.   

  
 

Director Approval (Attach): Yes  
 

Is the proposal submitted for a different Department?: No  
 

If submitting for a different department, what is that department name?:   
 

Grant Application Due Date: 12/16/2022  
 

Source of Notification of Grant Solicitation: Administering Agency  
 

If Other, provide source:   
 

FOR OMB USE ONLY BELOW THIS LINE: **PLEASE DO NOT ENTER DATA BELOW THIS LINE**  
 

Grant Status: Submitted to OMB  
 

OPUS Project #:   
 

Grant Contract #:   
 

Award Amount:   
 

OMB Comments:   
 

Granicus #:   
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Modify my alert settings | View Grants Database
 

 


